T T T R RN THNESY Y T TR

Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV(N)/634/2021-2023

©
eHRE MASOHID
Government of Kerala
2023

CHOG NMQ
KERALA GAZETTE

@G MoWIMmeMo
'EXTRAORDINARY

@R W60 1H20W] (oI eq]S)0mmMo)
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@ UMMal)®o, 2023 awlmoenid 09

it g w 09th December 2023
de ‘ 1199 auyvalldo 23 m“ﬁf 4006
Vol. XII i 23rd Vrischikam 1199 ;
iruvananthapuram,
Saturday 1945 @R|{WaNIWMo 18

18th Agrahayana 1945

e i e A e

ea—— = . e —

CHOB MVBANID

moa (Moo dldamiem-mil) aldla]

all22amoaliMo

maud 64/ee1ud.adl1/2023/ml@ae. @lojImamayoo, 2023 awlrvosnid 8
1199 ayo2iléo 22

1945 @roan0@mo 17.

P

2023 awluoenid 7-0. TG 08 WAUBERAE llgoenItee STV @69 |0
603lmmMS ealomiEmeanses @rdlaleeesno@l] L@IMOTS (EIMilRLESIEMIM].
NAUBEROIDS om0 (@000,

6. 2. VM@ HBOB,
ml@a eav5ol.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




2023-9e1 3-20 MmouA a23lmadms

2023-0e1 ehog aymlmilgoeidl (ccewoi) sadalmmdas

200®  OloJepfleslon  ag)siaiommoens  mueiorveoicd 808  NAIBeNA

ailgesnioeqgs)omlwaos,

1994-081 e0:08 mmlaily joeid] @oeig allemsgo
CRRVO) OalgRM@Imss

80)
a0dWlmadm’

oll0ls,.—1994-081  ee0s aymlandlajoeild) CRG  WGIMIEUWDato  &IEMaN
BRYQUUDEBRUBLOI allenszie craL®) 821QUMO) WHMROWI BB E-@e0;

CHO8  MLoUOIM  Mlaaue MesmOBlagoom@imoeg  @om  quojo

- NSalSloWs)ess6moy @QOIUIMIBIM  MJaNaIIERUd  dllelnflenesnzany CH08
naidepadses eaiemldssimaimoelo;

WEajoUd, @AM, Sl Bl ROEMARISM@SS 213-00 @OMYE4JB0 (1)-00
UMW (15000 M@re)a|s @PUWle:06am03 aflaflewoaui]

2] 08 (ol T 10T} ISP O
s30dwlmnmday allgosniosnsiommy—

1 2108960  (I10moral0.—(1) o2 gadllmmadlal  2023-ee G088
amlavlajoeildl (eeevad)) ssadallmmms @) Gald alo@Io.

(2) 200 9508 (@106n1L1ODI WD QIO 6T,

2. 1994-9e1 20-00 @ODG DIDL00ele:n00) eran 821Q)6)a |ESENZ®IEN).—s0D
sodallmmdmy mlenfeldsoym @oeions 1994-001 e208 ayimilqjoelldl @redlay
(1994-081 20) (DBIMEUDHO (@IWIM @OSG af)Mmosny 1002duBle9eas)s) 3 aym@d

26 o0 alsejeslod QUSR8 DVIBlBNM™M crRGIG Do allew@now)
eloenieimenzoilclesimmosny,

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala, gov.in/

NP 3 N RCITA N IRON GNP TR AR



3. 5800 Qidaflss eeWGL—EIWom Gogleel 58-00 aidaflead (1)-00
9allBlfl®  “CoHUDaITlalSIZ:UD,” o)  AWOSSIMY  allaDO®IMe  GUDatH0
“@0ellmimomi@:06mo,” ag)M QRS aflamalje @aldessemz®mas).

4. XVlag) af)aN @RELYDo EalBBO@.—aIWOM @RG:QIeel 325-00 Qld:)afla) Guoanalo
“@0ellmic 8B OAIYM” af)MM UBlBaHSHOMIMMGSlLMIDI] “BPERLPDo XVI af)”.
@) @al@EHOENZMIE.

5. 32500) o) aR}GI® Qldhla] EaIBHO@.—EIWIM BRGHIT, “@GRERLO@o XVI ag)
00ellmieanid ©68:@:005 §alQY@”, ag)M UTlBHSHOBIN GUDaHo MIDE alOWIMM Qldhla]
82l13BHHENMRMIE), BRIV DOY:—

“32500). __ 0I3QJalDo—E0®  @RELPVWODIOMP@Ie 5800  Qldafloag@io
BRAIUODIGRIB00®]  “@2ellmimoMi@:06moe”  af)MOM  aIOAdLlmie 2UdO.OSISS
moellmieansies  cId@IClEe®, GUDAIDEM., NMINMo, MoBEOEMo,  ToMUd:D6Mo
GRORIBIG HOQIFIV@ ag)M GRG@ODIHIAMNDIEN) .

allvodle,0emoe.—so® @RRELPVOD@D 9ale@Uilajlgi8smio ale)H
ldgallaflSlepomoye agymomd 1986-0e! aldlndlal (ooduem) @ra:dlelo (1986-o6!
29-00 (B ERSY) EPMING Hl¥ad ensossilgiss algeglelle mldg)ailsjlsissmmoe
AWOBNGUWBEO)  (ICINERRBBN0  IMNM® Gogele alg@nslele @RS
DINOE@D0 MWHNDISIBS @OE® BRAMOUD 2eNWIAlean;M@o6N).”.

6. 326-00 QI IS8 BEENEI.—EIWOM ERB:FIOL! 326-00 Al flad,—

(i) (lag) 2alGT aldOo ©IOPODM Dalda] GaldELSETZMOSN),
BRIV .—

“(1ag)) DD GRELPDOTIE DD ARGFIN Glslenss aigsmglelo, 1986-a8
aolnudlall (ooasem) @o@:glme (1986-081 29-00 GH(B @Rag) GPolmd ol
oemoeslwlsies alseamglele QIO 6aDGIFISSOIRO@ moellmymemis:eemaacl
nIWee]s omlavlejoellglwles aggld &Sad:B)o DOMOAUIGIMEER8l0 2 }ODEIGSlo
sosmmileld  dledcdonoldesmmie, »vemavlad @RI  BHSaS)o
SOMOUIGIMEBBRSL0 alO®EIBSlo HIVE®IO! AIEaIM MIBQ) a0lEHeEMRMAI6eM.”;

(i) @EISID0 aldDo GaldB66a]g (1lag) Dalaldha{la) GUdaHo @ISO
9alaldha] G2lBGHOETEMIEN), BOGIV):— :

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(lageg) (1ag) aiaidla] @Isd0NES 3(h'lcr6]9doeﬂg'l®gs)s SHSOBHBo
2OmoIED)eE1RS )0 2)ODEISS)0 mlBqjanlesssnzoy DIGVE:STel W)
20moRElmawlclesimamo, MBS0l ERO® coaNEINSS DOMON] MIGEUM
@oellmimemisosmo, Bal0ORMICDINSo, UORail®lo, agyerailfldlouy agymlaies
aRa@EIDS8 263 NMOdEN  HlaImeeIden @oop@lad  mmlavlaoeigloles
acgemesleno 9BROWILOBEHD Zlaimeerdesno, MDY HBIHSEDI
@lesuosEngiesed  emoellayes mjeoIOGilomews  @slmunomoricd af@aflap
M@ BIUM Do, BROMDo SO U, DOMONIIEIDEERUD, 2NADEIBHUB @RI B®§RID]
mldajadlesym e’ 20} QID}EDMENZ@MI6M.

(iii) (3)-00 QalalBlofla) ald0o @IDLODIM  DalQdh)a] GaldEBOETR®IGNT,
BRMIWD):—

“3) aywlondlojoeilgles), emaleso, @RogIBI® a@oomlege @R aislews
o@BMl  afles %008  @pslunomosiesn, @BRLPO@EDO MV BBFleen
@oOIBSISlenss aigamsiee, @oegIElod 1986-6e! alclnudlel (roossem) @yeglngo
(1986-081 29-00 ax(B @ROLY) @GN Sl9lenss aigemsgleen oss @oellmymemiaeoem
eludommemud  meaImied  cIrleacews o21QpM@I (@ dle.nememud

Y 3

aRBB6)a]S)OmoaRM@IE.”.

7. 326-00 Qidlofla) @UDaHo o i@l QldhlaB:UB BalBSO@.—(IWIm agysgleet 326-00

Qldhla fla @UDako @O OWIAN QUdhla 1B GalBEHOEMRMIEN, BRIV @:—

“326a0). VB96038 ddeguoeanud @msndailad Mseq flencsssmzmsemary —(1)
DY eoegin sldeen moeog@lod 1986-081 wGlrudlo (Monoxem) @oegleen
(1986-081 2900 Goy(B @RHY)  GR@ImEISod 2emoslallgiss  aigemdleen
auomdellmy moemis:0smanasw MNITWe]S MBL6ID alj08q)siaileanm mldeguosemud
Msaflelnesssnzo Bvendmileilong 20moandlmaoldles mmosny.

@) (1)-00 Pataidseflcd Qmamduo’lg’lgggg mldeguosanginow] SIS S
®QO0LSl®  @pmeNz Svendaileiloag OMISSIOD  EWINOTI@ AL O
8).21@ACIPTVEM 20 [ICHDEMRDMe  BREISIOMBS  @o=ez D SH0emailad
Glojaomens)esssnzmmoens.

3 @-o0 alQdla] (ISH00088 aBomBlene  mldeguosamud eiélaf
BROMOo m?r&cgcmmuﬂmmgﬁu;@momﬂ 80} omOdlmssl®, evemaila
@o)R0MeDSIeaM o@D lRIBDAUYSIM  qumdeemEl®, @romoo mldeguoeanud

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala. gov.in/




msaflensoymoilmss  eemaci &:vemailed  @oule:0lajmoc™o RS D®EDO
BHOJOE)|ESENZ®IEM).

4) (300  Qaldidla] (EISHOOMB8  BRoUIBI00 MBIV
SO}OOS)M OO HSDISS @OOMDe GIO)MIMEBBUB MSqflernemm i) amE@.sol
9sMsl MSalSleUd  HOBHOBHNIEI[EMMe  @ROMODo  @IOAIMe  MSq fle1osemM @lad
OME@S0leLe neQamsslele 2OMEEIMIO]S 2EBPWIVNEMI alddR@end afl¢ale@d
96moWISIOMmBIR @@ Siminileenandll  HeMENIss  HMES0InLOTIOdE™O
@RELBIT  @ROMOe  DEBPNMNOHMDMIONOEWI  MBHNIBI  @RYSHS  MSals]
aujleclesdammosm.

(5) (1)-20 2alid)o] @lIB:00m88 MBH6ICIOM Mlde3ueERUd aldellesmmalcd
Soemavl@d  afldal  aEEmIMaldto, @vemmilellomdloo mfle:clesdanm  og
MSalSleUde@HdMle  Boo  AIEIGmAIlWEMI@, MALIdl @POmE.  aflfaiaies
Svemavlellend eam alle apaamoaamamos: ;

af)AMO@, @@lB»H0o afle apaomM@la) ami @:vemalela) alo@aMS8o
alO@QIOM MP@AI® @RIV NTBEHENSIG).

326enil. moelmieNI&:0emOmIG aavEd:Solwes somoaddlmisenyd.—(1) o
@OELEWOTIOL AIMIOBHUD Lloelleelm oBO®IT) ARSIOMTIOOD0 HIVESOIHE

BOAMSISIGUD BBOEEH0AM M0, ag)IMITD DD @YY (a16:00600 BRI S15lenss
2ISEIRUD (IBHO0ERD POSEIWOLHOARM BIQMIMIEERUY IHlWOLHIAUM@)AIE.

(2) moellmymomi@:eemaiadl smmué%_Jg“ S0 @PERLOWODIM B1¥le886mMO
@RORIBIT OTDIVADo (INIEIOTIENSS ace@Blele TRA (EIGI0MSIE®I CBO®
2)AOLIGUD B00ieHnn MB3QOleamM@ImSs «f)glo @PWI@:006ERSl HIVBSOIBS
96mo@dlea)m moem.

(3) 9aVB501HE, P@PAUUDLISEBREI®, 6.21WBGaIFTVEEM @IWls) GUDdao,
20ellmMoi@eema@I@]l  MIMWER]S WY  GRELPOBTICED  @@IVA®o
@loenielomlenss aegeosslele MloEI&d0end @mMIG Mlstlcmaow 2)ODEISHUD
Mldgjadlesmmailal  sninweels lalgj@d  anendlcd il @enE eldsto QIR
S0 M@ §a1L1T HaIQI0RM @M.

3260, caid@ldlay moellmie mywlaileoefiglessd @RI H D g@mnﬁaﬂccﬂ@o
005000)M@Imss somoandlmie—(1) emE@sdl, swuomemoginilenes mldegudlal
@000, cadMIdls  moellmemnud  e@esno0)malemd Mgy  UORIOO

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




mledsallosymailems @aud ol aylmilopoeiiglessd @roulley® agemdailesso
M@MMTINY0 ag)gld alls)audasio agomsileno alBlMOERSOSW)o, Ba0ISE, lcle Velolqr 8
QUATMODo, BRHUDI@, ERELBI® acgamBlele MuodaliMo ag)mlailes 9SOMOAB L0
DOBAUUNLIBHN e DOMOQIEID] BeNodles;mmoens.

(2) (1)-00 2alaiBq{loR! QINNG:0D Lloselleem a@emOo) aglowlocndd
OME@S0166 EDI00 DI B0WICTH®]0 aIGlmoloe 0l Sailwocmminow
alle anaomoammosm.

32608l opaud  odoneoell  enioweals  asoiuos@d—(1)  &06oo
ol foeilglele  acellne  ecudcldleacd, ewsaieme,  NBONDO, MVoRAEMo,
MoMV&06Me @R  HeQolasd a@Mlu@ao®]  nIMbees  ETLOIMEERUD
MBSO al}demend Rouil®:en0 @o® ealeial Qladlosym@lad 8060 moeflmy

DMalOGHMP MDMEBHENE @ITVB  aflons wlvnilesommipe @y mluniaileeym
dololad ewwsiclesnsmonosmy:

a)Mo@d, @B oddl’ VBE9R Mloes Dl aflgissaiaso, VA0

dlumdlly  dlossdlemssdrd  apeom  adloes  emendailcs mlvaileanad
aloslgjoam@oe.

(2) 820600 moellmy 2@al10E:mYe @AVA adlmy aymlndlejoeilglesss anegslo
a@oOBleRe @RUlG®  agmmaleesd B0 DOMOBIOI®Ie  @RAITVOM

DNON6e; 2}  GregBlTd aymldlajoelldl  allo@omleajeecaym  @oomo
@oeiwgailmiasierd mmesemmosns.

() agooslene @moelmy 9¥alore:d (2)-00 Dalldla] (@IS000 QQIMO
Pal0oIgI88 @d  adlmy @psYeaMmala@  all$ainiojomlood, @nos, eI@l@omvo
BOMUO) LOODIMo all®EIS)e:)S] WSIESHERMmIENS: '

a)Mo@d, mlvaile clool oo O®gMI0 Alairuomlmeutatange @VAE ablmy
@RSDVLM@ITB all¥al LTI 20@En GO0 aile EDDSIBHIUIM 2 10S)88).

@) @8 ablavye alle@io 538 enil Udlaflad @iolatodlajldlesim allwe
OO0 S)SlyFle@o0 Bemesdss SDDSIHHNM@IEN.,

5) @ud oS arsoesrnd aldaaimomm erslemailen
mfledlessanan DEQO®BIEo  MSaISIGWBOS  Rowo AU, @VB bl
BRSVHNM OO BROMOOTI@ alléal Aio)oTiw @gln il joeldlolad mlmss
ABOMI0} EILAIMAL M@HMB HAVEB:SOlH6 allovenailesaamamasn,

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps://compose.kerala.gov.in/

4




(6) MudeeOClEMO @REaRIEHIE, 3:0e08:eIERSIE MVBH9IB alj0eq siallesym
22d@mldegusauisommmardl,  oymimigjoeilglessns  ogomeslege  @moeillmy
90al0BHOM BROEIEI@ MILllny 2BalIBEH0}OS NIEMEO, @RI BRYOSISeTHEmI
aYlenm) SISeNMEMO CP® OBSISERBINS 2SAHOS ERELIBIG HOHAUNDLHIOD
@A adlond @RSWLNM @D ol al)AepDICO RIUISH@OCWO
s%l0890M®I6M.”.

8. 327-00 Qidh)aflmialdro {0 [) Qo] GalBHH@.—@IWIm @ygleal 327-0o

QAU flY aldh®o MIOFL O QUdsla] GaIBEHOENZDOEN), BRI MY :—

“327. auomoelmieanud  mocdleam@lmle  mledHalleaamaimie  adeflms

OWaloBHBLN8S  2100RIeud—(1) esmaumelnEnsle  GresmuncelmiERs
@OaIBHSHONOD  NIBa0le  moellmieansle  MuordlemM@IMI]  algeengleeld
RENICLIBS]CRI0 mldemailajsiss (@1200EMO @R6p|eslcd IgME=Te]

Ml Batd ol BlOM DM} GalIHEIMBBEMO @R QlLle |OleRe MloOMIEMSS (ICDID
enflm}@,680 MoReMIGes0 ueadle:dleesnsmzo 660 MIelmy 9MaldBHOTIo
SO0

(2) @REROM@ISS NN EVORIBIT MVoROEMIBUD af)Lld VOO0
ol Mlelod meHlessamzmie, HAVGSC @M@ Ao Haldmiemosiaiimocd
mI3e3uBlaniam @Yo ag)gipe EREBHMWSS MLOLIOID) me22d] & 0leH9 RO,

3) mdlmilojoelldl  alleoilaflgiss  ellaimeeddeEHH0  HOIN@:IBESSD
@oODOo Melmisanud ag)Blo oI  cuoaIdlesM@Imie  Mlaso ea1gRM @M@l
&0e00 m0elmy 9@alor@:mie algamslead HeMIEEGSlee Mlaie:daHlof8S (1000
@oellmsenud cId@ola) Mleddallessenmos.

(4) (3)-00 alaidiafloel alINuOBUd £loaflBe)0M aBOMI0) AYBIOSW]o CADD,
IV@S0les BRI OJalIEd GIOWITHe alGIMITI0e B)el@ FNoll Wil (e lnlel)]
afle anaomoaim@os.”.

9. 328-00 Qidlaflmsa BRBNDI.—( WM BRGleel 328-00 Qo flad,—

() 203N @ UIBHSOTD ald0o ®IHLO@IM 20BH M@ UTIBaHBr0
GalBCHRENRMIGT), CRMIVT).—

“nopllmyenud  aflese  eaigumailal  @oellmy  2®aloBHMIMOCDO
9SATLOMIAICWI MIRAVEHIDMAICWO OB H0B™;

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




(i) wleinileyss aoimoaiee “agomsens BRSPS SHMUOMAIEI
@ORAVHHOOMIAICWI”  o)AN  AUILNBHUWHE aldho  “@oeilmy DB lIBHHMIDICWI
@ORIBIT aBOMBIEN0 IBIIVEEMSIHS DSHMAMBIEWI MIDNVLHOOMIBICDI” af)(m
UOBND:SGlo “alG0d @LMIED o0 SalgM@INT” agyan QUILNHUDHE) aldhDdo
“@oellmyeanud aileso eaigumolal™ agyam QUIB:Blo GalBBHNETZMIE).

10. 329-90 QI ]M)ald00 NIV QIBa] GaIdEO@.—(@IWom @ogleal 329-00

QD fla) aldo @INLJODIM AUdla] EalBCLHEMRMIET, BRMIWDY:—

“329. a®@elsl @oeilmy eudaIneMo—(1) &560 aymlmila joeilglago mgh‘)’lcm’hacoﬁ
@lecroomas ogpo aflsi@gl®d  allmye =malm G(BeRgled  mlomyo - aemley

Mudalmeasgl@d mlamle ag AN aidlrvosmsla mlmye nlan)milel ©@:slseanyd,
el aoemlsy aqvaysj@enud, noso.03, al0Bafls mualaj@Em o@enAIeSs
BOOIOTIR IO  SUISODIG  dileans BIGVE:Ro)| &ald@memosladimocd
Tladiedasllaflgies  acgeo®lene  muoemsgled  mlemo eud®ldla) @oellmisanyd
@3l@dqys] cuoaudleaymalmiss @ ale:0smerud BB ]0S0CHNEMRMOEN).

@) (1) galidle] @IS0 GUDAUM] ) ®omdlaflgiss  aoellmsenud
voadl@owi] NSV B99SIO® NS0 @TIlEmo midemodesmmaomilems  calend
DHIEMECIIDIBCDI af) DT BOBHEWI 621D alslgpommoe.”.

11. 331-90 Qi e flss eeEVN.—@nIwom @ gleel 331-00 QU)o flad,—

(D (1)-00 DalaiBlafldl als0o IDLHODIM  alQidla] GalBESOEMIRMOENT,
BOMIV@) ' —

‘(1) suo, @, oellmse GrepBI®@ oo O MMIBO6M oo
DEPOOD®Mo  BIN @ (IBBOBIMEemm all0sOmO  aslevmalsamm e
995UDNSSMMOD amlalaelld), eromaes HWOMPSHEB TVVHOIEBRES (@ISO
Rlalwled mundalleeymalmies aienoile.vd DYBUNEMM M@ oBOQSIELOMRMmOE.”;

(i) @ISOV aldro €al8098q]3 (1)-00 DaluBalM)EUDato @I Ca O
2ol PAHUD GaIBEHEEMTRMIT, GOV —

“(1ag) &0e00  aywlavlepeldlmge aceflmymemisosmamly  eaiendl
Il ®  Iecueme.emmo all0GO0  EPMIEWIWIMOD  (UIBHIDE)a
HOEMEOMENRMIo @RAUDBRSIG 2013-021 3 90Q Q) BB BBIMIMBETVHAD @G
Eodatoom@mil m epad @o@flolauas, Slanoenilellegannd  @rag dlemugladendy

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala.gov.in/




@oag (2013-9e1 3000  eHM@ ORSY) (@eooemd  cal  algmcdecd
(0B alISOMIEMI V]EIOIAUIBROB MIGEUMEDO QUMD Brydeedlecsoenzmos.

(1eni) (lag) Soludla] (@IS0 @aMIMilejoeilgl aodzeleam @
mdseodleon oMod  Gomeololgpe®m  negem®ilele  GRHAIUDIERUDIEHOT
9aICWIUIEIM alS}BSL.

(Amd)  moellmymomidoem  (IaIdEmMaRWeaIW] aslemm)  @lseaym
e @eled  oenglad  dlesldono®  eEle@d  elR@IeMBI®  @ROWOY
allleourflammaila’ 8060 mymilmdle peilglmye mamdwsmm madesemrz@Is).

(1)) @oellmimnoomieem (I3OmMEERUdEeI®] Mdal Dale@ouslafloyamoe
a)MO@  eafoud allolw  H0EMEMSIM  ValERWOULIIBHIDOAIW z)oll@d
aoellmimemisoem (IR MEBRUD alMOOoElEMM@IMN LW  af)EJd
msaislegio aymlavlejoeilgl mjle.dlesssmzmosny:

a)MI®, MBSIDOE MW EEMEAT]  DEPE® IO ®@)al
26OGOIUUDOBIM0 calendl  MOFlAIDHNBHEWI  DalEWIUIAERMHEO 6210

aloslgjo@mmaem.”;

(i) (2)-00 Daludlfld “(1)-00 Qaldd)afi@ld00 oLl allz2emoalio
§.2IQRENIOUB” )M ENVESGIMI EREOOTIM]o aflam@@ilmle QUIBNGUDBHBN0 ald:@o
“(1ag)) 2alaidsla] (1000 GJE] HOEMTOMENIIUD” af)iM ENVHOQle BRHOARC GVSHUOo
QBN Blo Bal@EHNMNZMIE). .

12. 332-00 Qidhlofla) GUDato @D Qldbla1dhud G2IRBOM.—(EIWIM @RYBFIeL

332-00 Qo fla) GUDaHo IO QAU la i Ud C2IBEHHEMTE®IET, GREIWOY:—

33200,  Uo@em  00ellmaomSS0em o IcL@e:ud U02a flea®d.—
ayrlndlejoeildles, @memailod @r@le000 Aopomlen e @ReRII®M MA860d
@ISOV BRHAUUDIOISIGHED  OaIPMMOUBIE, DEQEMBILN0 MEGUD (V|@oROEM
U000 IMONAOD]  €aldMS, EROmOo MEZUD  TVoREEMMAIMEBBUD @oUld@la
(@I200M8s  MININLMGSlo  QAUSAUMOS]0 @omMdlal MBSId  DELIBOWS]
alj0eq siellesjescanmm 223 MIBEZUDEBBUBHEY allew@aowl TV
20elmiMMI&06M alELEIG:Ud Mu0dailaedaRmM@Ie.

332enil. mladleoeilg) al@laooil 101U WMM@]0 mldlaemallo

gggda)%;sg@mm@oamaﬁ'.—mgm'lﬂdgoeﬂg']@'laEJ 22ellmniea @06 (@ IAIBOMMEBBRB

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

L@ &H8)o @RQOIUINO®  AIMBEMLEIRUD aloeila)jed06mz)o, mleailenss
mleasmuesmimimaclgiadeny ladosilasmemmye  msqflensemmemmno
90a JUOOM D] eELls6 0] (DO al@leunowma}o midlesemaio
MSEMIMBGIMIUDAOD (05l 06mMeBRUD aR3B6|SICODENRDY ol joeilglayes
Blolclelelell k2108 ; :

3320l aemlasies  someandoisnss QOB Glealods
SaQM@INes o lodlemonylaamsie.—(1)  som @ORLPVOWIOL  AKAIMNSSBIOS

a@emBrlene elocaimend @egmlcd Salomimuoeienglelo  ReNRERI0 @oeflmye
aellesclos, ossie @oeg®l®  Mledtallons  agamlal e Osw)ss
@2eilmimemi@:esmanasai] MMWSS  aBo@Blele  SQamIERD, MosnImMUila)
ailiesenud agemodwde)o VB S0] MBaioe s, dleqjods eaigpanmmosm.

@) eyoladlapeldless mde0d  @oensoeimsios aljoeq]siailesym
00dQmldeguosmudes allewmacwl,  (1)-00 QalQidhla]  (@IS000  ElocRIMEBRSLo
SRD(OIEBRBl0 016 odS O2IQRMM ABBBHUBES o I10BlcmV6r0 M@ D6,

(3) 20QuEOBEd  eEINEDD  Maxisenn DEMISNM  OOOTIDD
GJOIERUDICOMOINSEWI BMsal}3QMoeWI (1)-00 alQlda] (18000 OO 60} Oleaods
MABEIM aRBO®IVISYo, HIQMOOIMODBIBEad, aiilmoiios ©lad AUHO BRB:OORM afl®
NS WBleHlo0eq|esenzmosny.

332aul.  moellmieais0em  esmeanudes il IN)S8 VL0368
(LICDIVMH0M0@ QNI N UD.—(1) ayrlodlepeildles,  audesd DENVHE)M
2l3EBRUBEH0  all0eq siallesyam 28@mildeguoeamudessd  allewmasal, (¥ N(g el PN 1)
22ellm§meie:0em  eo (Reard anogiI@ mldmmodmem uoelesnud  agymloiyes
OMOZSIOW MIBMIleamMdHs Mleo adlansssen DIAUSHEBI CHHUN o lRLGIBES80
2B OSB8I O@I® M@0 aldladlmeqsiomoamw)ss 2F CEINONIOMEBBS]o
M@B0QM@I6NT.

2) aydladlajoeiiglesy, een oo 22ellmymemie:06m G (RsaRUd @neglslod
widemodesmm munesmud ag)mlues HMISSIOM ®IDAVlSNMAID)OS CHHDODIMYo
allemazomilmye eaens) 0B8N B03, Bglnuneisnd, Oleemuglou’ TUDSHOIEERUS, MVJIa]
CaOa b, oblmileem  esalailus MOSOEBRUD sl DalCIN (IR0
(EIEGRIBMH00)M0® MVQIlWIMEmRUd aR3B8a]SIOMmInM®o6N.”,

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala. gov.in/




11

13. 333-00 QI lN8S 6EEVDI.—EIWIM BR&Fler! 333-00 aldfled dlaallenss

aumn @@leng (1)-00 alQldlejod] @ReeEIeSem®m)e  BREIMI0e @REsalg (1)-00

9alQldhlqlN)EUDaHe MOOPO@IMN DalQldhla] CalBEHOEMRM®mI), CRMIWDY:—

“2) @IB®IMIB HINETO® @M  @aom  dlaime  ayemusslelo
ailmdle oelidlo® erdlolestem, aseimadmilgpom agomeslene. muoelos mydleiulso
@RSIBBIOS 60} al@laldSIC@O BTMEIOBCEI MoLiSlefleadm aloslgoem®yo, @m0
@RYESI @ROMOo  al0laldSIWHS qLoERINSHEMO  D0allsoml@ @emm  @moeflmye
caddldlesymeaim’ 90qjesssm®le Mmlmiejoelgl mlumidles;m odny mcde)
oylmile Joedlg) 20@eleSIomIlgies moeflmge GUDEUTI @AM AUBEH6
aBRMIVBUBEH60 @RO) HOBDICOLTZMIAIEN):

aMO@, @O0  aflid:ud  moellmiMeMiGeemOTIMEs WM
©a1RI0NleMBUd 06T  MIBIBHOM  aldSlgPOm)e GR@  mmImigjoeildl
M13eguolenie (@100 BIMBEL00W BRSWESOETZORAIE.”.

14. 33400 QIdafl0F aid®o NI Gidhle] EalBO@ —@IWOm Grsdleer 334m
QUda|Njald®0 I alO@IM Qldhla] G2lBGHEMRMIEN, BRIV :—

“334m)l. poellmimomie:06m anenElend olafle:cemoe.—(1) saed aymlandle joeflglage

“00ellmiaTVBH06M a06NE” ag)M GalBl@ B} aneNS olafle:0lessememio, @M MBH6HID
9ENZIHNMM 2ISERUIEHND alj0Selsiallesym 203@RMIBEGUOEBRUIEHN @RMIV{®RODI]
063000 2IBYENIMBOE. '

(2) @0ellmioMIH:6M an6eNElERIes) @O ]oIMAl QIo] QUDEHEMRDIG,

@RI —

(@) 20elmymcaie:06m  eloceimengi@o®]  snIMWe]S  ollewoc@o
SalMO@FIWICDI SDDSIBEN® M}HdhUd;

(6nfl) @ellMIEAVB06M  (EIUBODMEBUBHSHID]  620BJE0g  BIVIAHI® -
eomieatsmmienilelldl (nfl.agm.ea.) anendlad alamye eila (MoERIAUIM B UB;

(@) v epawdovlealsed®] eldla MiGaoemdaUABatle] @30
pegemeslelo MeEdAIMB:E8I;

(W) MBReed Mldegullesim asgemsslelo @iedaud.

(3) 206N ISP |O@IM @YQUUDIEERUDLOIDI],—

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

(@) @oeilmeEngles caIdoldleadd, cuwaIosmo, NGINDO, al@laloeimo,
MoMId6Mo, MIdEMOd2ERMoe  ag)arilal 2UBOOSDYBS, a)IMOT OB M@0
1B ®eSIOmIOD, ag)plo Belmimuemisoem (UBODMEBRUBHE)0;

(enil) @O0BGHANID 22l SH0MOTIMIIDAID  Sald:0emeaRUd
QOEERM@IMYo Munda fl@emalmyo;

(d)  @oellmimoemise.oemavsiad agdeqjsloleeym slaimeeones @l
@oolage  adedlyflesymalmicanidw)ss aloludleimomimie 00560 allaaum
aJ@la10S]B U3 B6)0;

(@) aBe938  @PoUledlay @2eilmymomi@oemanasw] NITWEIRS
DEROMB;1EN0 (@ IIBODMEBRUBH]0

DaleoUilessemmas.

15. 335-00 Qidlefla) ald®o ol Qldhla] B2lBHN@.—(I1WIM @&gleal 335-00

Qo flniatdoo MIOODWIMM Q)] G2IBCLHEMRMIET, BRI DT —

“335. &SeOsWIe el Q0. IMERNIOSDIs o ldlauoe Qoo
W sHlenimalmss 2OMOUIEI®0.—(1) 630600 &HSQIOS®]o QIoemleay
MO INOTIOM@DIe  aldlovoe  aEBI@oo) reHleasemzm)o @olon  aldlruoomn
ooeflmp  arllesidloys.ewo MSBYBHCWI  HODNB6)BEWI 021QODIB| 86 B0
' @ogBIl@  @oollon  adlrvoo agomsrlelo  aoellme  aiellesdl@osmo
®SJEMO  SOTIHHICMI  DalCRISMILOOS @Ml eeddlea o 8).2ICQYENRD)
2SAWIPSEWI HOHOIUDBHIVHFEWI DODOUIG] )] powlalesymmmosn.

@) (D00 patusafloer ainicuoswdass alloevmod) «geomsilene @oud
@Jmémoﬂ_y;amnﬁ BETUO WS SODD, HAV(EBS0IEH6), OTV(EB SO (ICD o
ARAGEINSIODID HERIOWMNENMI @OODHOo UBDIOS a8 @OQODI0e Ojat alle
ANAODIMIET.

(3) (2)-00 Pal0id)aPeIs000 ANOOMOSISISS afle, @R alaoTie Cloo)
2@ alimerai dlairvomimssiicd BRSWEHNENZMo B(ald:I00 @RS ENM DI afl$al
UQOBIO@®, OGS, ERWIVBHBTIO0 of)SISNQNM BY MSalSIeUdHs Rowo
oo allwomlad, GO, 2aHMB MSaisleud @R OoElesssmzm)mey.

ilvodls06mo.—snm Usaflod  eoUOBIeIs90), ‘@ s@ud, ‘uoemileay
0JalMo’ agyaml QIDB6)) B UDH6) @LOJ(B Mo 1960-0pe1 CHO8  HSHS)o

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

apemlLiMuooaImeasgle @&  (1960-9e1 34) @paes M@Hl]ss GRE®
@RAMOERUD 9eMIGleamM@Is).”.

16. 337-00 Qo fla) ald®o a)OI® Qldla] GaIBHH@.—(@IWIM e@gleeal 337-00

QU)o {lNald00 MIOF alO@M Udla] CaldeoONIMOEM, @RI D) :—

“337, 9a16@oUTlal HQISSo Hald®) MNLIERSICLIGHND 201000 EBBSICRIGHI
FNONMO MSD@.—(1) WIODIDIBlo aBOOBIEN0 MUlES, 21008, HGIFOD), EaNOSW,
osqyooad, afls, QITVO®  aUNdAIMo, @RUDMIM GregElc ag UNdaIMerRUd
agmlaled  mlmee  eellmmen, ©a0®) GO AIERGUD, E0IW, e®OLO,
Dalom)MOLl, REID®o @RORIMIG |eIdd@o agyMlailsenglealas 8918w
S9106008 - @RMINIGSIHEDI GRELIIT BPOMO. aldlovossgled mlm @rome.
9016@IUTla] BAISSe  BNAOOM  BRMIUEIEE)HEDI aRegEIm  @@IM}
SI0EMAIB)BHCDI §)21QOND aldSIpjoTH@IE).

(2) (1)00 DalaiSaflorl AQIMOSU3 elotellee;m o@e®I0Igleng@io codd
OME@SG106 @RYIV0o O}V HI0OTH®Y0 ag)MIT @RNIGIMID0o e I@A@
H0ICD®MDOD afl 2A@BOM@OE).

(3) om@giles, o@ge®lele ©ald®) goocwleelesed  S0SWIGRIGSSD
omo)aflceieesd  @ReIBIT  06QOOHele  HaldIOIVOLICOMESND @ep|scd
2enOERsieeessd aelmeelo 8980 @MIAGlSNIM BO®Blele §5lGyd SYGsTII
@pegl® acgemBiele M0GRENd GPSWSHNAIEMI MISIAIEMI @egEl@  Mleso
_ @algpaoeme  emogly  meaim  @RAOMOO alBlovoomleng — 9SBEIESI
99 HAUDOHOVEMIESI MIBEZUTIBSHOAAN@IE).

(4) (3)-00 9a10Bra Yo l00m8s WIBEZUvo e1@la] a@O®0008)0 (H3eGUDo LIEla]
a@¥ Alanvomlmesicd GROmOo Mde3uoenud aldeileasnzmio GROMo M1Be3UEBRUD
woellesymailod  @oward  ofl¢alaioyomil@ows, OaU@SOl, (2)-00 DalQidhla] (@IS0
fledleecanm «pe®ilele MSalSleudes Goo QEOD, @M ®8alqe], syeni
@egl@ aF MIBQERUY BRSWIONGEDI BISIHEDI GRORIBIM MBe0 6.21QNE:ERO
9alEQEME®o LB calemd )M ®@Idmo  ealelal  @oWIglad mlonoe

SDDSICHHENZOAIEM).”.

17. 340-00 Qi) fla) ald®o @D Qldhla] GalBLHD.—(IUWIM aagleel 340-00
QU laT ald00 @INFJOIM QB o] EaldeoeENE@I6N, @RI —

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




14

“340. @alomMOEIERSICRIEHN0 V00  quorisrsleeicae 2oeflmse
aielloslolomaimies  dleoowmo.—(1) @oeilmse  sosim@ilmyeaiend] 9e3Uileeee]s

quoeieasgloenslos,  emoailesss  asailesn Sald@MTUOLIGOMI = @ISDMIOIBYo
a@o®milene  moellmge aellogoloyecmo  aellesdlemmy QUOD]EHSIBNBHEDI
MBBYHECWI  HOVIBNBHEDO ¥l DISIHEDD @ROLIBIMD @ROMDo (A INIBOT B UD
S2IGM AT B:006MAIAUS:EDI §)21QYIM o 0SIPBDBEHYM).

2) mldepalafgissoy @ieo0eno @regBlos OS0! aj06a]s)0ilay
aldeguosmud @rmavdleslo @ogpem IMIVIBLo aRO®B;IRI}0 MU0 MuneIeERs
acellmpe  aellegcloysmewo  aellesdleomy UODICHSOBNBHEWI  DBB)BHEDO
HOTVNONBHEWO  BH}Fla)) 0]S)1HEO @ReRBIM  EROMOo (@ INIBEYD) 821gM @I
B0EMBINUBERO HalYIB aI0SIQOOD@IBM].

(3 (D)0 galusfeeicwo (2)-00 alidlaflOBlc®d  aNIMOGUBHS
allojevno®l ogemsilene @rud Eludomlajsaiary BENUOWIOISIM, OMV@SOIEH60
OMVH30l D ERAIDODTICEIED) Ie®idho @PUlB:006q|S)ODIQ DEBRIUNMUOEMD
CROMOe BYSOS A D@BTVAWo @RYIDI Do D)ot aile 2O DG,

(4) (3)-00 Qatalda] (18000 2AODOq|S o il @@ anpovile dloo aymc
aldlme!  dlaimosimsslod @RSWBEHNENMRMYo @ (aldd0o @RSPEMDID afl$al
UOOTI O, ©TVEBSI], BPWIVOBTIeD amsgass)amgnn aBOMB Lo MSaiSleudos
@oo AUDIOD), Gl ldoMIlSHYaHMD MSalSleud @ROEIBINENMAIE.”.

18. 340ag) QI )lo ) alB®o an@l@ Qldla] EaIBHH@.—@IWom @agleel 340ag)

QIS fl) aldr0o ®IOSODIM Qo] Gal@ELHEMEMIS, BRI —

“3409@ ooeilmend sl ollwdme  aidmisecss s QweESslello
Zele@oqusdlete  alesms lesmalmss afle0owme.—(1) @oemonos)o 6alom)
2eIMIBROIeED =eNwODIea zelemooqieen acellmeas aaens allrvudmes
QUMD EHESD aellogcloymmen mssimews @ooleeiss oellmeele  Q9}e6&ewo
a@eoomlene Seo)nilm  mly  enoileess DSBTo  BNBIMW  @PMIAUGEIL) B
®Regl@ aellmeel. aroleelss agisoad @PMElBeLBEI, negamsilene alwosied
2elo 2ellmaee)e:eo @eeB@s, Gromo. 80} IO DM OGN Greca@sileno
dlodlseseews mlewoulesiecmo mldenumulasecwo eeldloflesymews oaigpad
l0Slgjomm@BL M.

This is a digitally signed Gazette,
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




15

(2) (D00 alaidhla] @EIH0DB8 6O} SlQo  edoaaunallenilgle om0
SDRJOOM @DV BB @}BOEM).

(3) (100 Dalidafl@® alE0ABUBISNM HiGe Sl  aBO®ICOS)o
HHQTUOIINODIET alGINIB]Ro O IDI@B SHIOIOD@Yo @oMal®ImMI]oo ®)alt@il@d
soloiemwmss  allswle @3 MMOTIG BSOSO} QUBHODITD
salwiomwnes ®sale NS voleHlaseq]esenzmosm.”.

19. 3406nil QiG] ald0o o )TI® Qidle] E2IBHO@.—(EIWOIM anagleel 340snil

QB0 ald00 IOSODWYM Qlde] EalBEnEMmIENT, BRIV —

“340enfl.  ooellmiend  oflavdeiINiGRE0ES0 8 E06N2)Ca 10BN @AY

9a169UIla) QI0a0Mo o ilSl61a)SIe6EI0 BHENEad:gele—(1) 0D @RELPWODIM Sl¥lenss
B0} QSO0 ©2IGRMTIMESS DEFUDBAMINSED  BOJOHEOMINSED moefllmyemo

allonvdeeey QUM EHESO BalOMMLOLIOTILIOSEO BalomMIOOMILNESEDI
HSODOBEI6NE)CalIBIMNEDI @LOOID @ (ald00 mleaalasmala
9ale@IUajBIMEUDato BITIOB CaldBMBE®I @R@eman MP@AOX Mouo@ileedmd
SHO06MABE  §O)  QDAOMOOD  @RERIII®  WIMaI(@OOD, MV S0lE@O Q@
@AUUDODBIERIED]  HIVEST] @RUB:006|SIOTID oyl joeliglalonr &)
96RPMNEMI,  aueni OBMIDaIR0)eS GOl  HOWOCD B8O Gatoeflony
96EEMMOEMO ailSles)Sicanamz™ye, anuwleodlomss quenl alaflausmad aglavesq
0}030.10618> aDIROIEHNENITRAET.

(2) @OEMHEMOBIM GUDaHo, SOV @RELPOBID BlSlenss a@OmEHIE0
HIQOHIOIEEBUD QD QAIdaOMo GRORIEIIT  WIMaII@o Daleouilajlsieenzary
alloilesomd  MPDEO®  SH00EMAEETaY  quent aflaflaemed  asdladesglal
GENIOWSEQ]SOM,  @REIROM alleaSiom  QoedMo  GRERIBI  @OMeld@o
HEMRIDBSOUM @0, BRI DaldhHo, @O m’lgg,mmﬁeae,m@gmaarﬁ. -

(3) QPOMOTIHMED  IMI(@CTIONFEWI  SAWESSD @egBlcd
@dl@d mlmoesmd @ allslesSIomo @RIdEs—

() QI0aDMEAI @OMald(@E@O B6RIOBFMD &006MAOW
Mo BHO8H)0la] @ODIOS cOaION LI @OI0fl 2f19206nE 60} GNOZITT MBBIO@WY;

&S00

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala.gov.in/




16

(i) @eNs0:30MI88 H006M@TOMGIO0, emaglmil@d aemacssialisss
MPDVAO®  MADOTIMSS@B, @RWIDLS) alO@IAOMISS® OO MPWAOIW
@AMV M@ BIHMDo

09 Qldla] @ISV a@OOBIERS UIOMEND QWIMalI(MERI HENEHFIMIBE OOHOQT
a06S}ailee0m aloslgjoammasny.

@) odlslogsiom apeomomilesn @aman@aonsileen moellmiead alaieno
@oogiElad  almdemens oss MmBBREmMEI®,  aOMEDd  WIMIN®ERD
aflsloajsioaim @ww, @regaos OMEB30leRIBI®, @OOMO llslesisiced 9sm
oM@l @ndlwlesnsnzmyo, @ELOOBIN S ag)S}end0RmMm a@BeOmBslele
MSalSle:ud8s) Rotio QIDIOD, QRaNMOTIORe0 WOMa@OTIOMPEWO  9sAWIES
Saleioilad moellmie, alud eregmBlw allvdmmEmud amuwsdl dleso §21CQYENRO)0
LEBOM MWlHvo ealguMdImes ®2lei0l)o  @RQIVI0e Ol B allwoom aflew)o
OME30] 2sawil@d mlmjo EDDSIBHOENZMAI6NT,

(3) ap.omend womalo@end DSEMOBUM  MonGIV®D  @od celelo
DaICQYNE®Yo  @PEROM  2IdGNM o) poellmymomis:osm  anendleeiess  aioal
QU CHNEMRONAIENT.”.

20. 345-00 aiBlellmiss CRAVM].—(@IWIM @Ragleel 345-00 o fl@d, “Gooud,
3400p) Baflod  adlWlola 92U s)MgPe WG )M QBB RBBN0

aflamoilnge @OBOBBUDAE}0 BRAHHODTIMYo .l do “@P@IUBHSY, Y @reLPOI

26Q0alsOm)o WleHOIM]o @b s DlSlgoe@ss)md” )M AUENSB0  aflamale
GalBCHEM®IET,

o

21. 34500 oyan anmil@ Qdhla] CaIBHNT@.—IWom @&gleel 345-00 Qi flay
GUDato MIOODIM QAUBa | EalBEBOMR®IENT, EP®IDGS—

“3450g). adle anaommay Moosniauila) QiOITVDG U3 —(1) 340-06 Qldjalelo 340

o) Qidlaflelo al00adwlaflsiss wBleweud a¥losss o @RERLPVWOMIM Slsleel
WIODIO} aflojo— '

() @@ anmomom SHIVEMMIW cmocnco)lﬂ,agoeowg @PWINS
GoEUOA}Rl0 @POID 4fidB:06nE &30) EMASIN M@BB00®D)0; B)S0O®

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala_gov.in/




17

(ii) @) Al OOMIMSS HHOVEMOTION@ISHO, emoslavlad
ML DIgies MP@2I® MOROBIMSSI®, @PIBHS  alOWUIMISSOY
l0®QIM S0} VIV MBBBHIODD}o :

. OS0! alAEMONB aloSlglomm®Os).

(2) (1)-00 9alaldsla] @100 alle dlumiaiienam MVGIBEl, eVl
@Ol 2udeqasidlesim moelmiooien aeleje @ReRWIG @ogal, afls, ewnogm@,
QI§QIMUO@o, B MDD INEBRUD n.g)mﬂmcmgas ®©o, Qleljajo, MUOOMo HISOOD, MBH6Id
D @71ELI0600] 9EMROENGEWI al3061]SAll8e]@>EI 621DBTISISS a@o®Bsleio 21560
@negBl@d 03QMIl3e3uERUd ag)aMIQl HEMBESILISIEHSETR®OSM).

(3) 0 @PELPOBID ST ANAODIM RO} ale@io 5386nil 1By {l@D
10003UB 2 ISI8S (18:000 aldEMIBITH HSlFlSHe@M Galderl EDMSOBHNENZAIEM).”.

22. 509-00 Qlda l)es RENON.—(EIWIM GBSl 509-00 Al lod,—

(i) (1)-00 DalQidlofl@d “390” ag)am @psaeIm B)dal “326a0V), 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)aN @RHOERBI0 CVHHO0 aflameEngo GolBEHeEMEmIE); .

(i) (6)-00 Dalaidrlglld “390" agym @RSOOBIAT @yadal “326md), 327, 335, 337,
340,” o) EVEOEEBS0 @OMHO0 aflaMeaRSlo CalBEHENRMIM;

(i) (7)00 Qalaidhlafl@d “390” ag)m EREOOBINY @ymdat “326anl, 327, 335, 337,
340,” og)0M BRHOEBLo GOHHO}0 aflamean8lo GalBEHOEMBMIET).

23. 565-00 m:ﬂ:;%g'lmggg 8REUNML.—(@IWIm @R&Fleel 565-00 Qi) fl@d,—

(i) (2)-00 @umce,g%ﬂm& (@) CUEMLODMIMEUDaHo ISP O GUEMLEERUD

GalBEHOENRMmIEN, CRMIQVO).—

“(afl) @ELPWOo XVIag)y-Cilad ABmassIwlgIss moeilmy oM E06MABI]

nIqWweals allati@eamud;

(wepyy) 1986-oe adlmublo)l  (ooeuem) @Eglmio (1986-6)91 29-00
cnm  Ooag) coold &l gmoesiolgies algERUdee)  oflew@addl]
Bldmosm-eanslees  ooellmenud, e-ameilmieEnrud, wlafloy  @oeilmyeasud,

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

BRAISHSHOMID  1NBanld:  @oellmysanud, Ole  moellmyenud, @amoelmysarud
)@@ NINWEe]S Aflasieasud.”;

(i) (4)-00 Qaludlafl®d “GReTNS B)alcIsL” )M QAUIBNDHUDHE) alddo
“al@ImMoDiloo B}alE@IB0” af)MN QUOLOIBUD CalBELHENZBIEN.

24. 570-90 Qi) |N)88 6RRNDI.—(EIWOm @R &dleel 570-00 Qlda{l@d,—

() (@) suemwowlad “Gre0) OelecwIss” ag)m ma.ﬁega,cr&.bs? ald®o
“al®IMIDiloo ®laie@oge” ag)im QUIBND:Blo “TRMIM) 0JaiCIB" a)IM QDA UBHE
ald®0 “SDOIMIG B)alEIB” ag)im QUISNBBlo BaIBEHNENZMIENT:

(i) (eni)) suemwEWI@ “@ooum) ©alE@IBo” a)M  QUILNBRES ald:do
“e0 oM OJalc@ose” )M AUILNBUD Gal@EHDEMZMIENT, :

25. 572-00 aidlaflonss  ecen@i]—@iwom @oagloal 572-00 Qe (1)-00

Dalaidfofl®d, “MUBLHE”  agm AWl cUDao, “ERORIBI - MREI3
@oWlB008SioTl® 9eMIaN” o) QUISENHUD BalBCHHENTRDIET.

26. Moo alSle@ess  eRRVGI.—@Iwom: @&l  Moeldo alsgleolod

“OWIOEM UBlAUBUD” ag)m UBlBaHBODTIBEIA@ (1)-00 GBSO @B, —
(i) 335-00 Bl lomaen,—

(ag))' (3)-00 O8O0 "RNUAIERSlo 21080 avellmieangio
cafamgm’kmmacm dolole oasegpslesima” )N UONBHUBSE) aldhDo “D:SHBIOS Do
QUEMIBIMNNI IMEIBIOSWYo  atBlaVOo ool qesilesrmss somoodlomie”
ag)M QAUISHBUD GalBEHOER®IENT: :

(eni) (4)-00 so:O8OTIER ‘@O0 ©at”  ag)m QBN BHUWDELE) . ald Do
“al®Imoilooe ®)at” )M QUIBE)HUD emcﬂc&om@oaﬁ;

(i) 337-00  Qidajo, @n@lom@lioowiss (3), (4) ag)ml  esoseslsel
2860l 810 a¥lnI0sHNETRmO6NS: '

(ii) 339-00 s flonalon (4)-00 esosomiod "oyl GRMIG @)t )
UIBND:UBHE ald:®o “BRYGYOV0 B’ )M UISNEUD BalBBHOEMTZMIENS:

This is a digitally signed Gazette,
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala.gov.in/




19

(iv) 34000 Qidsleflondlon (@00 GLISOWIC “0emOlce Bl M
QUOBNGUBBS ald00 “al@IMITIo BYal” af)MN AUOBS}EHUD CalBEHEEMZOEM). :

= . | e @@l ajanmd aI0M,
DUBGRE.

%

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps://compose kerala.gov.in/




20

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA

Law (Legislation-C) Department
NOTIFICATION

No. 64/Leg. C1/2023/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 8th December 2023

22nd Vrischikam, 1199
17th Agrahayana, 1945.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in English

language of the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2023 (3 0f 2023).

By order of the Governor,

K. G. SANAL KUMAR,
Law Secretary.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps://compose kerala.gov.in/




21

[Translation in English of “2023-e21 o088 omladlapeldl (6eevE)
aodawlmnmmd” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 3 OF 2023

THE KERALA MUNICIPALITY (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2023 '

Promulgatéd by the Governor of Kerala in the.Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic éf India.
AN
ORDINANCE
fﬁrther to amend the I(;ei'ala Municipality /#ct, 1994.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994

for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take

immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the

Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Municipality ( Amendment) Ordinance, 2023.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Act 20 of 1994 to be temporarily amended.Q'—Duringlthe period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (20 of 1994) (hereinafter referred to as the pﬁncipal

Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 to 26.

3. Amendment of section 58.—In sub—sectioﬁ (1) of section 58 of the principal Act, after the
words and symbof “welfare programmes,” the words and symbol “waste management,” shall be

inserted.

This is a digitally signed Gazette. :
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




=222,

4. Insertion of Chapter XVIA.—After section 325 of the principal Act and above the heading
“Management of waste ” ,“CHAPTER XVIA” shall be inserted.

5. Insertion of new section 3254 .—In the principal Act, after the heading “CHAPTER

XVIA, Management of waste ", the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“325A. Definition—For the purpose of this chapter and section 58, “waste management”

~ means the segregation,- collection, transportatlon storage, processing or disposal of waste, -

including solid waste.

Explanation.—Words and expressions used in this chapter and not defined, but defined in
the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the_rules made thereunder,'

shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the said Act and the rules.”.
6. Amendment of section 326.—In section 326 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1a), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1a) All the duties, respons1b1]1tles and functions of the municipality pertaining to
waste management as provided in this chapter and the rules made under this Act, and in the

Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made thereunder, shall

vest with the council, and the council shall discharge its duties, responsibilities and functions .

through the Secretary.”;

(i) after sub-section (1a), so substituted, the following sub-section, shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(laa) It shail be the responsibility of the Secretary to discharge the duties,
responsibilities and functions of the Municipality under sub-section (Ia) and the Secretary may
by order in writing entrust the sald duties to officers and employees having the charge of waste
management, public health, sanitation and engineering or any other officers or employees of the
Municipality, on the basis of streets or areas or the nature of work, and ensure that such duties,

responsibilities and functions are duly discharged by them
(iii) for sub-section (3) the followin'g sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The Municipality may directly or through any person or agency or on contract

basis or otherwise, make arrangements in whole or in part, for carrying out waste management

Thisisa digi!a!ly"signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps:/compose.kerala.gov.in/




7 Thls is a digitally signed Gazette.

23

activities under this Act and the rules made thereunder or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986

(Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder .”.

7. Insertion of new sections afier section 326.—After section 326 of the principal Act, the

following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“326 A. Council to carry out Government directions.—(1) It shall be the responsibility
of the council to carry out directions issued by the Government in pursuance of the solid waste
management under this Act or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986)

or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Chairperson shall ensure that the agenda prepared in connection with the

directions issued under sub-section (1) is placed before the council in its next meeting and the

. council shall take decision on such agenda .

(3) In cases where the council fails to take decision in accordance with the directions
issued under sub section (1) w1th1n one month of the receipt of the same, it shall be deemed that

permission for carrying out such directions has been approved or given by the council.

(4) The Secretary shall immediately take steps to implement such decisions,
including the deemed approval under sub-section (3), and if there is any failure or default by the
Secretary or any other responsible officer in implementing such decision, the Gevernment may
initiate disciplinary action against the Secretary or such officer, considering it as dereliction of
duty. '

(5) If the council fails to comply with the directions of the Government under
sub-section (1), the Government may, impose fine on the council, without prejudlce to any other

actions that may be initiated agamst the counc1l.
Provided that a reasonable opportunity of being heard shall be given to the council before
imposing the said fine.

~ 326B. Responsibilities of Secretary on waste management.—(1) The Secretary may
initiate legal actions against any person who contravenes the provisions of this chapter and may

compound offences which are compoundable under this Act or the rules made thereunder.

Authenhcny may be verified through https: f!compuse kerala.gov.in/




24

(2) The Sccretary shall have all the powers for effectively carrying out the
responsibilities regarding the waste management under this chapter or any other law for the tlme

being in force.

(3) The Secretary may, in éxigencies after informing the chairperson, expend an
amount not exceedmg two lakh rupees out of the municipal fund concerned, for discharging the
functlons vested with him under this chapter or any other law for the time being in force relating

to waste management.

326C. Responsibility to handover segregated waste to the Municipality or authorised
agency.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of every househol.d,'owners, occupiers of any premises,

hotel, restaurant, industry, hospital or any other establishment to hand over or deposit segregated

waste in the designated location and pay the user fee to the municipality or authorised agency as

directed by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees

but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under sub-

section (1).

326D. Piovzsrons relating 1o user fee—(1) Each Municipality shall fix a user fee, to
meet the whole or part of the cost for providing serv ices in connection with segregat:on collection,
transportation, storage, processing and disposal of waste on every waste generator and collect

the same in the manner as may be specified by the municipality:

Provided that if the Government have fixed the rate for user fee, the council shall not fix a

rate less than the rate fixed by the Government.

(2) Each waste generator shall pay the user fee to the Municipality or to any

authorised agency before the last date of every month or within such period as may be decided by

the Municipality.

(3) If any waste generator fails to pay the user fee as provided under sub-section {2)

it shall be recovered together with fine at the rate of fifty percent per month.

Provided that such fine shall be recovered only where such user fee ha: not been remitted

even after the expiry of mnety days from the specified dale

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps:/compose.kerala.gov.in/




25

(4) The user fee together with the fine shall be recovered as arrears of public revenue

as specified in section 538 B.

" (5) The Secretary, without prejudice to any other action that may be taken against the

defaulter of the user fee, may refuse to provide any service from the Municipality to such defaulter

" until the user fee is paid.

(6) The Government or in accordance with the guidelines as may be issued by the
Government from time to time, the Municipality may, exempt any waste generator or class of
waste generators or owners or occupiers of any unoccupied or vacant buildings, from the payment

of user fee in whole or in part.”.

8. Substitution of new section for section 327 —For section 327 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

«“327. Duties of waste generators for storage and d’eposit of solid waste—(1) 1t shall be
the duty of each waste generator to prbvide separate bins or receptacles of the size and colour, as-
may be prescribed in the rules or bye Jaws or as may be specified by the Secretary, for the purpose

of storage of biodegradable, non-biodegradable and domestic hazardous waste.

(2) Such bms or receptacles shall always be kept in good condition and shall be

“provided in such numbers and at such places as the Secretary may, from time to time, direct by

public notice.
- (3) Each waste generator shall segregate and deposit the waste, as specified in the
rules or bye laws, for easy collection and disposal of such waste by the employees or contractors
engaged by the Municipality.

(4) The Secretary may impose a fine whi;:h shall not be less than one thousand rupees
but not éxceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under sub-
section (3).”.

9. Amendment of section 328.—In section 328 of the principal Act,—
(i) for the marginal heading the following marginal hgading éhall be substituted,
namely:— |

“Contract with waste generator or owner or occupier for the removal of waste”;

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov. in/




9%

(1i) in the existing provision, for the words “the owner or occupler of any premises to
remove rubbish or fi lth” the words “the waste generator or owner or occupier of any premises for

the removal of waste shall be substituted.

10. Substitution of new section for section 329.—For section 329 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

£809" Door to door collection of waste.—( l) Each Municipality, in the municipal area,
shall arrange door to door collection of segregated waste from all households, settlements,

commercial institutions and other non-residential premises and in the case of multi-storied

buildings, large commercial complexes, malls, housing complexes, etc. from the entry gate or any

other location as may be specified by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) Segregated waste collected as per sub-section (1) shall not be transported or

brought for treatment or disposal unless it is properly covered.”
11. Amendment of section 331 —In section 331 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) A Mumcrpallty that does not have a solid, liquid, sewage, or faecal sludge
treatment plant -but possess vacant land within or outside the municipal area shall undertake

projects for the setting up of such plants or facrhtres on the said land on top priority.”"

(ii) after sub-section (1), so qubsututed the following sub -sections shall be inserted,

 namely:—

“(1a) Each Municipality shall identify suitable private land within or outside the
municipal area for the purpose of waste management, if necessary, acquire the land under the Right
to Fair Compensatlon and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act

2013 (Central Act 30 of 2013) or by land reImqurshment or on lease or through private purchase

(1b) The Iand acquired by the Mumcrpallry under the sub- sectlon (1a) shall not be

used for any other purpose without the prior sanction of the Govemment

(1c) Each Municipality shall give priority to utilise its own vacant land or land vested

in it for waste management activities where the land is available for the same.

This is a digitally signed Gazette
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala gov.in

-}




27

_ (1d) The Municipality shall take all possible steps to resume waste management
activities on the Iand, which was previously utilized for such activities but remains unused due to

various reasons:

Provided that such land shall not be diverted or utilised for any other purposes or activities

without prior sanction of the Government.”;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for th_e words, symbol, bracket and figure “notifying the land
under sub_-section (1)”, the words, symbol, bracket, ﬁguré and letter “identifying the land under

sub-section (1a) shall be substituted.

12. Insertion of new sections after section 332.-H—Aftt_:r section 332 of the principal Act, the

following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“332A. Sertiﬁg up of joint waste management projects.—The Municipality may, if the
Council so decides or if so required by the Government, set up joint waste management projects
with any other Local Self Government Institution on such terms and conditions, as may be agreed |
~ by such Local Self Government Institutions, subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the

Government in this regard.

' 33..2B.' Municipalitv to make. arrangement for conducting regular inspection and
_manitoring.—-lt shall be the responsibility of the municipality to make arrangements for
conducting régularinspections and monitoring of the waste management activities and projects
in the muniéipality to ensure that it is being operated or implemented in compliance with the

required standards and in accordance with the relevant laws.

332C. Responsibilities of individuals and rewards for reporting offences.—(1) Any
person may report before the Secretary regarding any violation of the provisions in this chapter or
any offence relating to waste management, including littering, dumping or throwing waste into -

public places and water bodies.

(2) Subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the Government, from time to time,
the Municipality may give rewards to persons who report violations and offences under

sub-section (1).

This is a digitally signed Gazette:.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in




28

(3) Any person who maliciously or intentionally makes a false report under
sub-section (1) to harm or cause loss to another person shall, on conviction, be punished with fine

which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

332D. Beneficial provisions for residents near to waste freatment Centres—(1) The
Municipality may, subject to the rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the Government,
provide incentives, including but not limited to tax exemptions or relaxations or welfare schemes

to the residents in the immediate vicinity of centralised waste treatment centres or disposal sites.

(2) The Municipality may establish convenient and beneficial facilities such as parks,
playgrounds, récycling facilities, swap shops and physical training facilities, for the well-being
and recreational opportunities of the residents in the vicinity of centralised waste treatment centres

or dispesal sites.”.

13. Amendment of section 333 —In section 333 of the principal Act, the existing provision
shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following

sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) No person shall organise an eveﬁt or gathering of more than one hundred persons

“atany unlicensed place without intimating the Municipality, at least three working days in advance
and such person or the organiser of such event shall ensure segregation of waste at source and
handing over of the same to the waste collector or agency as spemﬁed by the Mumclpallty on such

fees as may be fixed by the Mumc:lpal:ty

Provided that such fees shall not be less than the actual rate of cost for the ménagement of

- such waste and the same shall be paid in advance as directed by Municipality.”.

14. Substitution of new section for section 334 C.—For section 334 C of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“334C. Constitution of Waste Management Fund. —('1) Each Municipality shall
constitute a fund, by name, “Waste Management Fund”, and it shall be managed in accordance

with the rules made or guidelines issued by the Government .

(2) The following shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund, namely:—

This is a digitally signed Gazette. :
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




29

(a) amounts recovered as fine or penalty in connection with violations of waste

management;

(b) contributions received from Corporate Social Responsibility (CSR) funds for

the purpose of waste management;
(c) sponsorship amounts or any other contributions received for this purpose;
‘ (d) any other amount as specified by the Government..
(3) The Fund shall be utilised for the following purposes,—

(a) all waste management activities, including but not limited to segregation,

collection, transportation, management, processing, and disposal of waste;

(b purchase and installation of equipments necessary for effective waste

management;

(c) training and capacity development programmes to enhance the skills and

~ knowledge of employees engaged in waste_ management;

(d) any other activities related to waste rhanagement as approved by the

Government.”.

-15. Substitution of new. section for section. 335.—For section 335 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“335. Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments
clean.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of the owner or occupier of each shop and commercial
establishment to keep its premises clean and not to throw, litter, deposit or buin any waste on its

premises or allow customers to throw, litter, depos1t or burn any waste on its premises.

(2) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the purpose
may, on being satisﬁed that any person has acted in contravention of the provisions in sub-section

(I) impose a fine of five thousand rupees on such person.

(3) The fine 1mposed under sub-section (2) shall be remitted w1th1n fifteen days from
the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate prosecution

proceedings without prejudice to any other actions that may be taken against him.

This is a digitally signed Gazette
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose. kerala.gov.in/




30

Explanation.—For the purbose of this section, the words ‘shops’, ‘commercial establishment’
shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the Kerala Shops and Commercial
Establishments Act, 1960 ( 34 of 1960).”.

16. Substitution of new section for section 337 —For section 337 of the principal Act, the

followmg section shall be substltuted namely:—

“337. Prohibition of draining of used water into public places or water bodies —(1) No
_ person shail drain or allow to drain waste water from any sink, drain, stable, hotel, restaurant,
“household, industry, hospltal or other establishment into any public drain, road, street or public

place or water body or water course or allow or cause to drain such used water out of such premises.

(2) The Secretary may 1mpose a fine which shall not be less than five thousand rupees
but not exceeding fifty thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under

sub-section {1).

(3) The Secretary may, by notice, direct the owner or occupier of such premises to
close or shut or remove any pipe or tube or other means by which used water is allowed to flow

into any public road, drain or street or any other pub!ic place or water bodies.

(4) Any person who has been g:ven a direction-under sub-section (3) shall comply
with such directions within a period of seven days of its receipt and if he fails to comply with such A
directions, the Secretary shall, without prejudice to the actions that may be taken under sub-section :
(2), close, shut or remove such pipe, tube or other means and shall recover the actual expenditure

mncurred for such removal from him.”.

17. Substitution of new section for section 340.—For section 340 of the brin'cip'al Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340. Prohibition of throwing waste into public places or private places. --(1) No persen
shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste on any street, drain or public place that is not

intended for such use, or caused such acts to be done.

(2) No person shall throw litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste in any private places
or caused to do such acts, otherw1se as prescribed or in accordance with the directions 1ssued by

the Secretary.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala.gov.in/




31

(3) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the purpose
~ may, on being satisfied that any person has acted in contravention of the provisions in sub-sections '

(1) or (2), impose on the spot, a fine of five thousand rupees on such person.

(4) The fine imposed under sub-section '(3) shall be remitted within fifteen days from
the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate prosecution

proceedings, without prejudice to any other actions which may be taken against him.”.

18. Substitution of new section for section 3404.—For section 340 A of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340A. Prohibition of depositing waste or rubbish or excreta in water bodies and water
sources.—(1) No person shall throw or deposit waste or- rubbish or excreta in a water course,
water body or water source or allow or cause to flow water from any latrine or allow waste water
to flow into it or pollute the water in any other way or engage or depute or compel or instigate

any person to do such activity.
(2) An offence under sub-section (1) shall be cognizab]e' and ndn-bailable.

(3) Whoever commits an offence referred to in sub—section (1), shall, on conviétion,
be punishable w1th fine which shall not be less than ten thousand rupees but not exceeding fifty
thousand rupees and with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but not

exceeding one year.”.

19. Substitution of new section for section 340 B.—For section 340 B of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340B. Seizire and confiscation of the vehicle used for carrying waste or excreta—(1)
The Secretary or an officer of the Mumclpahty authorised by the Secretary in this behalf or a Police
Officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector shall seize a vehicle or vessel carrying waste or
excreta through public place or public road with the intention or preparation to commit an offence
under this chapter or having reasonable cause to suspect that the vehicle or vessel is on its return
after being used for such deposit, and shall produce before the Sub Divisional Magistrate having
jurisdiction. ' '
?) Aﬂer conductmg inquiry, if the Sub Divisional Magistrate is satisfied that there 1s

reasonable ground to believe that the vehicle or vessel has been used for committing any offences

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose. kerala.gov.in/




=)

~ under ﬂ'llS chapter, the vehicle or vessel so seized may be conﬁscated and in any other case, it

shall be reieased

(3) No order confiscating anyAvehic]e or vessel shall be made under this section unless

the owner of such vehicle or vessel or the person from whom it is seized,—

(1) is given a notice in wrltmg mformmg h1m the grounds on which the vehlcle or

vessel is to be confiscated; and

(i) is given an opportunity of being heard agamst the ground of conﬁscatlon

~within such reasonable tlme as may be Spemﬁed in the nonce

(4) In cases where the vehicle or vessel seized contains waste, rubbish or excreta, the
person seizing the vehicle or vessel, if he is not the Secretary, shall immediately inform the
Secretary of such seizure, and the Secretary shall, without pI'EJlelCe to any action that may be
taken under this chapter, dispose of such waste, rubbish or excreta at the expense of the owner of
~ the vehicle or vessel, and the Secretary shall recover the cost of such disposal together with a fine

not exceeding five thousand rupees from the owner.

(5) Where the vehicle or vessel 1s confiscated, it shall be auctmned and the amount

so received shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund.”

20. Amendment of section 345._—In section 345 of the pﬁncipal Act, for the words, figure
and letter “and which does not fall under the purview of section 340A”, the words “for which no

punishment is provided elsewhere in this éhapter” shall be substituted.

21. Insertion of new section 3454.—After section 345 of the principal Act, the following

section shali be inserted, namely —

“345A. Provisfons regarding imposition of fine—(1) No fine under this chapter, except
penalty specified in sections 340 and 340A shall be imposed by the Secretary unless the person

concerned,—

(1) is given a notice in writing informing him of the grounds on which the fine is

to be imposed; and

(ii) is glvcn an opportunity of being heard within such reasonable time as may be

specified in the notice.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

W




33

(2) While fixing the fine under sub-section (1), the Secretary shall consider the size
or quantity of the waste involved, the category, size and location of the household, hotel, industry
or other establishment and any rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the Government

in this behalf.

(3) Any fine imposed under this chapter shall be recovered as arrears of public

revenue as specified in section 538 B.”.
22. Amendment of section 509.—In section 509 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), before the figure “390” the figures, letter and symbols “326C, 327,
335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted; - |

(ii) in sub-section (6), before the figure “390” the figures, letter and symbols “326C,
327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted;

- (i) in sub—section'('l), before the figure “390” the figures, letter, and symbols “326C,
327,335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted.

23. Amendment of section 565.—1In section 565 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (2) after clause (u) the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
“(v) matters relating to waste management as specified in chaptef XVIA,;

(w) matters relating to construction demolition waste, e-waste, sanitary waste,
- domestic hazardous waste, plastic waste and liquid waste subject to the Environment (Protection)
: Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”;

(i) in sub-section (4) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

24. Amendment of section 570.—In section 570 of the principal Act,—

(i) in clause (a), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees”’
and for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be

- substituted.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose.kerala.gov.in/




34

25. Amendment of section 572.—In sub-section (1) of section 572 of the principal Act, after

the word “Govemment”, the words “or an officer authorised by the Government” shall be inserted.

26. Amendment of Fourth Schedule —In the Fourth Schedule of the prmmpal Act, under the

heading “Penalties” in column ( D—
(i) against section 335,—

(2) in column (3), for the words” Improper'dis_posal of carcasses rubbish and filth”
the words “Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments clean™
shall be substituted;_

(b) in column (4), for the words “Rupees five hundred” the words “Rupees ten
thousand” shall be substituted;

(ii) section 337 and the entries against it in cclurnns (3) and (4) shall be omitted:

(111) agamst section 339 in column (4), for the words “Rupees two hundred and ﬁﬂy”
the words “Rupees five thousand” shall be substltuted

(iv) against sectlon 340, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two thousand” the words -

“Rupees ten thousand” shall be substituted.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2023 ‘o

This is a digitally signed Gazetre, :
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala. goviin/

Digitally signed by Veeran T
Date:2023.12.09 11:48:38 +05:30





