© Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
CHRG MBH6ID ated 05-09-2012 with RNI
GOVemﬂzlggt“Of Kerala Reg No.KL/TV(N)/634/2021-2023
mQ
@ VoWIMmeMo
EXTRAORDINARY
@R W1ed@ &2 (altmfew e s;ommal
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
© UM ai)®o, 2024 223 5] 04
13 ek 04th March 2024
Setde 1199 @00 20 e 1 820
Vol. X1l Thinvasi . 20th Kumbham 1199 3
Monday 1945 a0d@N)Mo 14

14th Phalguna 1945
_—

G008 TVABNID

dloa (loanidamoemoe-mil) aidge]

Qil26malMo

- moud 64/ee1u7.ml1/2023/mloao. @IOUND 00, 2024 2oBa] 2

1199 sjorz0 18
1945 ano@duymo 12.

GH08 MLoMLNXM MIVWAATVEWOS @I ODIN @D O lOTRLRIMETRBIOS
@ndlaileelean®ll @M@ @ Imilevejsieman;. dloaaue aIO(ROSHD (IS00088

snilgfla’ 2024 @084 1-00 Bl KaIBeOES EPMEG] e1dlay.
nIdeMes 2Ol le:000,

aVl. ailmoelssiol,
V8o to)@B 6AVE50] (M1220).

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https:/compose kerala.gov.in/




2024-ee1 6-00 @YY
2024-ae1 608 n3MlmSlepeilgl (6een®l) Grye

1994-0e1 08 a)mladlajoeildl @ped aflensie ccawo) ealguM@lmes
630}
csg
afldle.—1994-0e1 em08 MMllejoelldl @OSG DOIMEUDHe  @:0emIM

@ROINDIEERUWEa0®I aflenzlo BRI 2IGRM G WIBMAIWICIE6B:WOLIo;

@00® OlojeRIle610M3 ag)SieiomIermIo0 ToQIBTVOCIT @I JODYo (1000
M ODENRISSIM}—

1. 210860 Ol (100oEAN—(1) gD @GN} 2024-081 €508 @il josilg)
(62RO @RSG  af) Gald alO@Io.

(2) o epadien 2500 aldfles (i), (vi) memud osmd (aJoeNnueI oI
QOM®o BUDHIENM Qldapdud 2023 aulavosnud 9-0o Dl (@loenieloolcd
QUM@ODYo BO}ME |ESENZTMOE).

2. 58-00 Qidlo lies eceE.—1994-081 08 B3MIMJleoellg] cpedlenl, (1994
eel 20)(@Im GUdaHo @ IWIM @G ag)MIEM l00ABUTlEeeS)E:) 58-00 Qi jlom
(1)-00 DalQidlefld “CoBaIBlaSIS:W,” ag aneslmo aflatn@Imie BUDaHO
“noellnyMoMIe:06mMo,” ag)M QU0ES}0 allaMalle GaIBGHOERMOEN).

3. XVia@) ag)M @RELPo BGalBHO@,—(IWom G@RG:dleel 325-00 B {lad
Guoaale  “doellne ©0@®@00 ©alg@” ol  WldasBomimimeglenmoall
“@RERLPDo XVI ag)” o) GalBEHOENEMIEM.

4. 325a0) o) o O Qldhla | GaIBLO@.—(IWIM ERSGI@, “@PELP@o  XVI
o) 20elNIEBUD HOB:EOR alQYM”, ag)M UBIBaUSODTIT) GUdaHo @I lOWIM
Qi) | BaldessemEmOosm, @ODOIWD)—

“3250g). DIBQUaINo—ED  @RELPVOMIOMP@Ye  58-00  Qldailod@lo
@YU ERIED] “noellmyrocie:oemo” agyamnomd suomoellmo
oudeqjes@ies moellmiEnses eaIdTIdlesdd, GUORINEMo, WMINMo, TVoEDEMo,
MVMSE:06Mo @RORIBIM B0QRSIM ag)M @RAGLAIEMN@IEN .

aillvodle:nemoe.—en® @RRLPVODITD fale@oUilaflgigsmio IO
- dAldqyallafdlepommpe  agmocd 1986081 aidlnudlal  (Tooeuem)  @B@E:dleno
(1986-081 2900 GHMB @OSY) GPOIM M gsmosdlalgss algamdlelo

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




Mldqailaflgissmmo®  Qem@:WBen  (EICOWEBRWEN0  (ITSm @Raglele
alg@nglee GRAIYES  DINO@Ae  M@SWISIes @re®  @RAGERUD
6moIdlesnmMm@osm.”.

5. 326-00 Qle MBS ¢EELTI.—EIWOM ARG:leal 326-00 Qidsa{led,—

() (1og) 2ol {ld) al®:00 @O O@M Salide] GaldeeesME@OENY,
@RIV D). —

“(1ag) v @peLPODIER DY GREGH ldleyss algeEngleo,
1986-0e1 alclaudloll (noo@sem) @redimie (1986-681 29-00 o @REJ) @RI
SlSlad pemosslalisiss algeangleno ol {folley\a) BRI OIS EEW ko)
aoellmimemia:osmogaoml  eniawen s mladl peildlones  agpp  @saesio
gmmoélmjsmggo aaOelSgl  svedadlellad et ioacaldlesmago,
VM@ @oleng ésasgl somoandlmians)o ARAGEISSlo OAVESO! BIEEUM
mdqQadlessenzonmoen’.”;

(ii) @IS0 ald:®o w@m%g (1agy) QGJQJCB:&(H']M‘ GUDaHo ISP JOIM
DalQldla] GalGEHOENMRMIENT, @BRGIWDY:—

“dagyag) (1ag)) Salaidla] (EISO0NESS ailadle jorildlayes
DHSOBHBlo  2OMOUGIMIERGle  ARAORIGBS  WIBQadleseeETT OaVE@SOleSs
20moaclo@dldleanmmle, ervwsdl erwa COEUOMEINSS SOMOO BIGEUM
@oellmymomieoemo, ©alomRRMICOINSe, UDRailldlo, ager@illdled’ agyamlaiwies
2R@EIMBS 2EEPNMNALee  HaIMeeIdee @reglmlad mmladla peilglaleer
negeomrlello 9esPVMUNdESs0 sflaIneeddess, MO BHBIOSEWO
(@JeR3UDEREOSEWO  emoeilyes aqraocﬁmuﬂem@a@o @oSIcOMOMITE  oB@Baflay
M@BHORMD®Y0, @OOMDo  BHSDBUD, DOMOAEGIERU, 2OOERIUD  @rald
S§on@0 Mldqjadlesymmiaaion 204 JOIO}ECODENEOR06N).”;

(i) (3)-00 2alQIda{l} atd:@o @690 RalQidhla] G2lGBSOETRMOET),
@ROIVOY.—

“(3) mymladlajoeilgless, emaleso, @egiEld ogoamslene @owd arslewo
a@eeBmil  aiflewo @008 @wslucomemileen, @RRPOHMEWO DD  @RGGlee
arclmdalslenss  aigeamseen, aregilad  1986-0e1  aidlnudlol  (quod@siem)
araaglecio (1986-001 29-00 @& @RaQ) @RIl &llepss aisangleen oss
20ellmiTecmie:06m  (@laIdEmmemnud  myeImso  @oUil@moewo a1gRM@ITY
(@21 206MEBRUD oG SICMORM@OE.”.,

6. 326-00 QIdqflaf EUBHo o NG QI&;;H;:&U& G2IBHO@.—(IWOm @RS dleoes

326-00 Q1dq{la¥ GUDako MOBIFe JoIM Qo JrUB GaIBELHENRMIEN), @RMIVD):—

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




“32600)a0B 0608 BlAEEUDEERUD B:veMaVkod ms, flesscsnamonsman.—(1) o
gt ldleen anegld 1986-081 adlnudlol (Tooeuem) @ Gleen
(1986-021 29-00 BB @RE:Q) @IS Sl Denzoeslwlgies aigeangleao auoaoeilmy
MoMU&0emaRM@]  NINWER]S MVUBLeB  al0eq|sialleeym mldeguosanud
Msq{lelesasnal @:msmmilelload somoalclmaolalesymamosn.

(2) (1)-90 QalQid)o{lcd umomc&u&l.ﬁ]g@é mldeguoeargy@o@ll enimwen s
®QO0oLsI® @ svemmilelang  HmISSIOm CWONOIM  AITeeMeIaT
©2IDBCIFIVEM D00 |0CSEMe @D IHI0MSS @pRemRAIGD  vemmilad
OOIROMNEONSIEAENZEREM.

(3) (100 2aldidla] (@ISHO0MSS agommileye mldeguosanud eiElaf
@oomoe  Mldeguosmudeemauimacel &0y  @omoBlmssic, verdavlad
SOIBOMOASIBMTIM 2 100RWESIM TVMBARERZT, EROMOe (de3UeERud
msaflenesmoimes @omacil @:0emailcd @poulle:dlamiewo M@EID@OEDO
B0} D |ESENZ®IEN).

@ (300 Saldl] ©@@oOMB8 @UlEO00 MA@ mowI
S0)DSIN}UB6 [HSDIBS CROMOo GOAIMEBRUD msqlenesmalal emuEsdl
9sms]l MSalSled HOBOOHEBSERMYe BROMAe GIVIAIMo mSeq flenesymalad
eau@siless asgemsileyo 2OMOAEIMISS gquocnmmem:; 2 I0IZRWEAD
- afi$aico  gerowligiesnz®ilad an®  ayoieileenainoos SHEMEOIBS
OME@STl00e0I00cw0 EERBIM GEOMOs YERPNMOOMBGINOEDO MVGLEOTITI
@2JSE8e MSals] uflaclescanm@yaosm.

(5) (0o Saludl] Eledomss qdLedled mlde3UERUd
anelleaymolad  evemmilad  ofl¥al  aIo)EmMald:o, avenmmilellomomlen
mfledlescarm ag MSaISle:udeee0mie Bolo aiooomaflwom@, adeealn
@ROmo all$aides evemdmileilang cam oile apacmoayma@oen:

ag)MOM, @100 afle apacmimM@ls ami evendaleilay A lO@QDMSST
20303 MPWAID GRAITVO MNABCHHENEMIE.

3266ni). 206l LMD HAVEB:SOIOS somoaocloeanud—(1) oo

@RELPOTISL! QIAINOGUD Lloreileanm o@e®On) aglomaleomie HIVE:S0l0s
BloamsaSed @ROoRlIEeARM@MIe, af)MOTE OV @G (@ ISHIVEND BRGNS
Slslenss 21568303 (@12:00B6RD ©023l@OLSARMM QB MEBRUD
©2=1@OLEQRM@BI6M.

@) ooelmymemieosmaaodll  mITWweR]s WY GERERLPODIM
SSleysscm0  @RORIITE O@IVAWe  (EeNIPOTIENSs acge@®ilele Mloa
(EIBHO0NSSET0 @R 2ROCEIBHUWD B00iEHAM0W] Mldgjadleaymalmss agglo
@nule:008mgle BIVESOlEs 2eMRITSIBleaM@os.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




3) equEngoles), @PMRNIVLISERSI, B2 IWAEIFTVeEM @Ol )
GUDato, BORIMIMMIG:EeMARAOWI] NIMWER]S DY ERERLPVODIEE GTBIVAW.
(@RenIeOmIeRss negemsslele M@ 1800620 MG Mledle Imaow ameleud
mldqjadlesym@ilal enimwer|s MMMl @ anerdl@®d ooy eend eleso OlaiW@d
B0 @B Baleinl ©.21Q0aMMIEN).

326a]. gaId@ildlay moeilmio madlale joeildleses @r.UIe:i® o@Eadmiless
905000 a@lmss someaRdl®io.—(1) eV, eatomemosimnileyes aldegudla
@000, euBDIdly @oellmemud  eemaccymalemo  Mlddly  muoekow

mleata lesymailemo @mud abdlad aymladlejoeildleesd @rosleym ogemmiesss
M@ aggP  oflsie:sies@le agem®ilene  aldlrvoERSIHSW]o, Ga00SOD,
OGIROONF, QUQITVOIWo, @YUV @PERIBIT BEgemBIleRo MVNIaIMo af)MIlUWOS
2SDMNBENe HOBQINLHIBL60 DOMONIEIMIMENRIWIBleaMOosN.

(2) (1)-00 2alaidaflor aQIMOSU elocelleam a@BO®IRSleOmR@lo
6@  oME@sOles ERIe BlIVI@  GOWOTHP  aldIMoDloe Ot
Sall@oom®@ow aile apacmoamoosns.

326al. @aUd _ odlovieooil NINWSIS  QIOINVNNSWB—(1) &6

vl peilglaze  moeilmie  cad@lcloamd, euoaiEemo, VEIN@., MVoROEMo,
MoMid06Mo  GRMIOM  HOQEFD@  agMlawEo] MITWe]s  GIVAIMERUD
M@BLMONOG «13epend coUldead @R ealeinl Aladleamala’ eoeoo @oeilmg
D@alBHMIo MWEBENE WA oflay dlunidlesssnzmle R mlvaiailesmm
OOl euoaIdlessNROBI6NS:

oM@, @M oblile’ MBee0d Mo MU 4flgesa Ieso, VBB
Olouwily  dlosslemsscd  @pemm  dloes  @vemaild  dlunidlescad
aloslploommos .

(2) @060 @moellmy 9@aBHMP @VE  adlad mmladla joeilgleae
@egIElad a@emsilele @U@ agmmmilessd ag)glo BoaVETIlaEI®lo @RAINIM
aloadles; aymoews aregslcd mdiladle oeillgl dlloyaoailesjeecanmm @remoo
aoeiwsallmasleelo madesenzmosny.

(3) agom®leye moellmy 9@aldce:m (2)-00 DalQidla] (@I@000 QIO
©2100l5i88 @A oblnd @rsesymalcd all$alnioyoilwos, @, Eiolacave
@RMUD) VOMBIMo o lPEWIS)MS] DBVSICHSENRMETS:

2q)Mo@d, mlunile aloal ae@ emogMmd dlalruamlmieudataRe @MV adlm
@RSDINM@I@ afl¥al QOO RO@ER @ROMO. alle LIDSIEMNAIOM o I10S)8s).

(4) @@ adlavye o fle@ye 538 enil Ao fl@d @I10Tlatodlafldlesam allwo
©aOMIB)0) BSlyPlB@ODI] B:6MEeBs) DVSIBSOAUM@OEN.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




G) @d o cersesom afldanimommm  epglemolen
mfledlescaym  acge@®lele MSaISIeWdes Goto QIE0em, @A  adlay
@OSTHNM®UO0 @ROMEOTI@ alldal aiomi@ a@pslad aymimle joeilgloicd
WlMISS GO0 EITVAIMALe MBI BAVEGSOlEs allmuaadlescaRmosn.

(6) qudeeIdlemd  @EERIBIGE  @0eNG:oeIERSIT . audeeod
aljoex]soflesyam 203(RMIBERUERBUBLOMIVI®EODI], mmladle joeilglese
a@oomlege moelmy 9@alos:em apegeslad noelmy 2@aldEHOOS WEMETTD),
BReRIBIM EROSOFITMEMI SYleM] HISEeOMETO TR DHSISBRBLOS DSNHHOS
@ROLIBI® HOBUUDEHO0 WMVE obln @RsDeeMaI@ Ml aydepacewo
BOUNSDO6@O BFINIDEH0QRM@OEM.”.

7-O0 D30 16,00 o NOID QId:la] E2IBHO@.—(EIWOM @RE:gIeel 327-00
QB l0F ald00 @OOELODIM Qld:le] GalBELOEMEGOEN), GRMOVO):—

“327. auomoellmeaud qocoleam@lmio wleoHa leanan@lmie  aoeilms
M I0CHALNSS _2lo@eidud.—(1) eemumoeilmsngio @Reee0Indelmieens]o

CRIGSHON0W  OBadle  moellmisEngle  Muocdle@symM@imoml  aigemgleeio
oosnicenagleen aldsplalsies @1e00ea0 @ReREI@ M@0l Mlatid:dala]l
BN DLE0NLIWSSEDO BRW Qe [OvleRe MIOTHIERMSS (@ Iemie: cnilme:e80
TocoeM@:ee0 qu2edle:dlceesnzo 60600 Moellmy D@a IGHETP@I0 HSAWIE.

(2) apanemiss nilmie:ud CPERIBIG  VoREMIGUd  ag)el
maomle Wdom dladilad  qulealessazml OOl EROD VAo
eatomemosiadimomd  mldegulleamM@@le  afigife  @REROMWISS QUOLIOYD
muedlB:0leLemEmR6).

(3) miadlaoeildl dleouilafisiss sdlaimeeddessd @000)BIB6He0
@O0 BelMIERUD ag)Sl T cuaIdleaMGIme ajless ealgpmM@Im@o®l
60600 2oellmy 2MWalBHMe alSEBSIERD  OeeNIGRIG:ElEe mlatia:Bal oflg88
(12000 Boeflmieasud cId@Idl gy MiedHa llaenenzmos.

(@) (3)00 Qaiaidlflee QAEQINNSUD eloceilean «BOGOOBIOSWI0
0@, OMBSOles @PWIoe OV  BOWICHONo al®moloe  ®ailad
Sl alle apacmoamM@osm.”.

8. 328-05 Qidlo fliss crgemcuﬂ.—(njwom' aaglet 32896 Gldafled,—

() 203lN@ UFRUBOTIN ald:0o MNP Jo@IM BOBHRIM@ UBlBattdro
G2IBBESENEMIET), CRTODD).:—

“aoeflmgenud  aflese  eaigum@ial  moellny  2@BalocHMBOCO
£SATMOMAICWI MIATVHSHIOMAICD D83 &0OQ7;

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(ii) mlelailenss anoiowleel “a@emssleno alolrooenses
2SATLOMIAIEWI  MIATVHIOMIAIEWI”  af)(M  QUILNHUHS ald:Oo “@oellmy
DM BHMIAIERO  @RSRIBIM  oROOBERo o ICITVO@ERBIOS  OSAMLOMIAOCWO
@IATVENIOMIAIEWI” af)(M QUILND:S)o “alQIGND moeﬂmsemo Mo a1gp @Iy
ag)M QOBNBHUWHE ald@o “@0ellmisanud alleso eaIgRM@INY” ag)m Qe8I

CG2lBCHOeMRmIeM.

9. 32900 Qldgimlaidte o@D Qldle] @2IB00@.—piwom crBdlee
329-00 QB l0Y aldr0o @O O QB ] BaIBELHENEMOENT, GRMODDY:—

“329. Q@ImBalsl moeilmy ewoaimemo.—(1) 60602 molavle oeilglae

Ol @ @leauoomes ogep ollsiedld dlmie Bmanay eomeanscd mlomie
Qemiy auodaimemglad mlmnie ag aver@o a.uo’kmmérmg’lmﬂ mlamie enianymlel
ooglsemnud, anemimy VBl jeMUd, MOBBW, aloBefls VAL WEERUD
MOEOVAIDVOS  SOOOBIBD  (@IEUDM  SHASOTI@  afleano OISO
Salomemoginilmom  mlatiedatilafigiss  acgeo®lege  munelierdl@d  aflemo
caidoilcly]  @oellmieanud  andl@deldl  ewaidlesymdlmss (@ dfle-oememmud

2386 |SICOMENZ®EN).

(@) (1)-% 2alaide] @I8000 GULDAIGLY MOodIGlaigias moeilmisancyd
vooloell ysloidensq|soem queaiaoemamiiemo mldamodeemamiems caend

B 06NZGa 0D HEO af) OB ONBEWO SR o ISIRJOCDOENS.”,

10. 331-00 0Idq NS RV~ 1LVOM @agleel 331-00 Qi {l@d,—

(D (1)-00 Qataidieflal alo:oo0 @299 O Daliidla] Gal@BLOENZmI6N),

. @OV —

“(1) sue, @y, aeilmzel @regl@ aflead SAYAWE TMoMIB:06M o003
DRPOO®e MMM @B (@ ICBOTIM@®EO™MO aRocOmd  aslemmelseam @l
998:0100MSSNAOW B)Mlmdla peildl], @Rome. oJorRid:es0 MVBEIERESD EITSo®

RII@ 0da leamM@INMSSs olevdle:ud n)dwemm M@de)] o3OS CAENZMOEM.”;

(i) @100 ald:do €2i8H68q]S (1)-00 Daltidlq lNEUDaHe @O oM

D0 iQId)o JHUD G2IBEHNENRMIET), GRMIV@):—

'I.'his is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/

b ol o SRRl e e o T T R o o o e sl




“(lag) 0600 oladlapelglol  mellmymcmianemania’  eaend
DM@ (@ICRLOBIMSEOMO  aROGOMO  GRMIEWIRIAOW  AVJBORYE}A
HOMREOMENZM) @RAIWIPAEBIM 2013-081 3 0607 Q) SO EHOIMUMETVaH
@ ©omMaleoommll om e @veflmilanad,  dlaooenilellegauad @
demvgl@ennd @oeq (2013-e81 3000 GHMB @RSQ)  (ISHOOCHO @)al
QAllSIN@BH@  @IS006D0 o OSOWIEMO  AUSOQUOERE  MEUMEWD  AUTVO]

@R CLEENEDAIEM).

(1enf) (lag) Saluda] @000 MMIMilajoeildl eErdmedlosian Rl
mdesodlon mMBed  @empoldigoem acgemslene  @RAIUDEEIRUBBHIGI

D0 IBROUIEHIM o I0S}BSOES.

(1)) moellmyruemisosm @laldammenudescdll aslatm; alseanm
qjme  @dlewo oeangl®d  dledaionow edlewo eRPOsIMBI®E  EROWO

allorfleoudlesimaila’ soeoo aymilavle peildlage aydumsmm madesenmos.

(1cwlh) moeflnimuomi@oem (EIIBOMMEERUDEe0D] ®0Bai

9alc@oUlafloyanmyoe ag)TO@ 80Bq JoUd allaflw SHOOEMEIRSOTD

DY (100100 P D () (I Iafels) clalol@d moelmyamomiaoem (@IUBOMMEBIUD
A} (NIRRT LW ag)Blo MSalSldslo il joeilg)
aujle:olesasrzmosn:

a)MOM, aURLSITIOM MW  @PMP®]  WRIPOD  (EITITR® @)l
DEOQOOOUUDOTIMYe  GRIENEl MO HEYMHEO D ICRONIBOBHEDWO  SaIQYID

aloslgjoom@osm.”;

(i) (2)00 Saludef@d “(1)-00 2alidlafleld00 aUOLl  Qlleamoaimo
©21QEMIOUD” ag)TD ENIOSOFIM}0 @REOOMIMI0 allaM@TINIe AOLB:UBHNO aldho
“1 ag) 2alidla] (@I5000 Rl SOEMROMIEMNIIUD" ag)(MN (ENIDSQ @REOQR

@BSHHO o QSN BGlo CalBEHENZMO6T).

11. 332-00 QI flaF GUWRaHo o BAND Qldhlo (B Ga2IBLOM. —IWOM ERBFIOL!

332-00 Q0¥ BUDHo G061 O Qldhlg RUD BaIBEAOENRMIE), BRMOWDY.—

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through hitps://compose.kerala.gov.in/

. NPT, Y



“332a0).M0o@H®  BOEIMIAVIVS06M  ol@D@NGU8  aunda loemd.—

iladlg joeildles, @:vendmilod @oe1so00 alloyaonileecmo areglod Mudead
@ 15000 BRYAUUDISS}HEDO HaIGRMaldHo, DEYOMEIRR MEGUD TVWoROEM
00 INARAOWS] 2130, EROMEe MEGUD VWREEMMOIMEIRU @RoUlB:la)
@1200MB8 MINIMLMS S QAAINVOB:So BRMIVBla] MAL603 HOilerIBaT)
al}0ex|syailesjeansanm 228MIBE3UDBRUBLE allewanow QN OIEY)

@2ellNIMOMIB6M aIRL@IE:Ud MuNda leeoaRmM@osNy.

332enil. il joeilg) al@lonail 2 10l6UDOWM™]o wldlesemano

2@306qiSieOmenEmoaemar.—amlavle pelldlalleear asellmymonieoem  @iaidomm
@nglo «lRLOIS:Sl @RIV MOMBEMDENRUD alellapedismle, dleileyss
rlaaruenmmimaodigacen  @iaIdomles memmlo MSq jlenesmemmio
900 BAUOOMMDIELIee0w] (&R0 al0leuooWwm@yo mldlesemaio
- MSOTM@IMOIDBOD  (BAHBEMEBBU wBBO|S}ETMENZT alanle peilglayes

oomoIRGlm@6em).

332adl.onemilasies  someoandmiamsie  @gaonend  dleqods
D21NMONMSS o Cleoatlee@sl.—(1) LD ERERLPOTINE! AOINOGEIOS
«BO@BLR0 LIRINERD @RSLIBIG SalomauneiEnrgleno menweanglene aoeflmye
cue.ﬂogcﬂcm;?s., mggcea @pegEl@d  mleadailess agyamlal U6 |OSW8S
moeilmimomig:oemanaomil ninwenls gemessleno DIQSIONEN0,  TVosTUANW]a)

ailaiesmud «@emoroudeeie BIVESO Mdal10ee: Oleg pds ealgpaymoens.

(2) mylandlejoeildless audoeend @orne:oeiErslcd a 06 sjaileaym
@0dymideguemudes allewasdll, (1)-00 Daldidla] (@ISHO00  LlocLIMEERS]0

DIQAIMIEERGL0 Olea P33 O21QRM ERBMUBES alddlemoatild:o MBE0RM@oENS,

(3) 2OV  BENGAD MaHSEDO  HENVLNM  OOOI@D
Bl0}EGURIGOMONSEWO MM }BQYROEO (1)-00 DalQldhe] (aIBOMo MOV KO}
OleaPdg M@EM «@O®IBIBe, SHIQIVNIINOTIBERM, «Idlmocloo @al QIO

@R00RM aily M@ Uolesleasa jesenzmoens.

33204l @oellmiTVeaIa06m e (BERUBEs audile 188  @OATVEeIBLS
(pICWOVMBHONOW AKAUNNHWB.—(1) aymimdlejoeilgles), qudeeod  semoesim

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

21SEERUBEHN0 o j0s|Siallesym modymideguosamuiessd allewmaod, eala:i®m
20eflmyToMIE:06m G (36ERUD @PeRIBI MIdENIdeem MLORIERUS ag)MlRIeS
eoSSOm  @oamilesmaides el aslanseeen  DsAR@®ES0 AU
AIRLO3E80 2B |OSDBS®0 DI M@  aldldl®eq SIOTOOOWSS  Ag

GIOBNVIaOMEERBle M@ SOQUMDIEM).

2 aymlalgjoeigles, eodley®  @oelmimomic:oem  eo (U
@negBla aildamodeeam mOoelEnrud ag)MIAI@eS HMISSIOT @IAMVILMAIOSS
coHAOmIMe ailemosomlmle eaIeNzl «ldB@L6}Eud, oe,g]a_uﬂmsmub, dlesaaugslou’
UDBHOYEERUD, V] GaHq P03, ablmileandd o0y’ muVH0iEERUd oysaEle

9aICOWN(EIGAI0 (A IGRORMGOARAID MoOMERUS aGAS [SITMOMMOs).”.

12._333-00 aioefloyss  eeenTl.—elwom @rsglee 333-00 aidgflcd
mlenilengs agoirun @RISR (1)-00 Dalidlep@] @REOGIESINEZM0 @IS0

@poedls (1)-00 9alaidaNiEUDaHo @OOYQODIM SalQidle] GaldELOEN®OEN),

@RIV~

“2) @OOMIDIBle @O M (ool Elairve  memussleno
adladlapeldo  andlalesnem, essiqum@ailgbo® ogom®Hlege ORI
mdleiflae @RSIESIes &0} «ldlSlewd  SOMEalnsed  aVoceSly{lesnad
a10SIRPOOM}0, RO @YESBD BROMOO aIBlaOSIWOS MVALIOSHHEMI sonallsomlad
@em aoellmie GIBGIBleamMIeNINTY 204 0eSeETIEM}0 MMIMSle joeildl mlvniwleanan
aflS m@de) ayailadlejoeildl apamelsgsiomialgies aceilmie euoadleaMAIBEse

aBERMBIVEUDEH60 @D HOBAICOENRMAIE.

a)MOM, @ROMOo  aflTVI@d  @oeilMIMoMiG:eeMETMIMSs  @LNIAMO
@21210lleNae0ud @106 MIEBOL0M  aloslppam®me @R@® MMMl jeilg]

Mldeguileslo (1000 MMBI00 GRSDIELEIRmR06M.”.

13. 334 Ia {105 0100 o RN Qldila ] E2I38O@.—a1WOm EREGoe! 334l

Qldle {lMjaiddo @OOY IO Qldsla] GalBEORETE@I6), BROOIWD).—

“334ql.

aydladlejoeidlale  "@oellmimcmi@:0em  aneNE” o)  Gal0l® @M a06ng

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

o) lodlesncnzolp, @RO MUBEHOB DEMROLOIM 2ISEBUBEHE0 0 ]S0lleem
20BRMIBEGUDERUBEESO @DMIATVIDRIW HEBE:000 6)2ICQENEDNMOE).

(2) ooellmgomieeem  anendlesiss) @O jO@IMAl il
QD EHENRMIE), @RMOQDD):—

(ag)) @0LlM§TVMIB:06m  loceIMEIRSAOW] ENITNWEL]S allewoewo
S IMOMFIWICWO SDVSILSI® @YBrdHUD;

(eni)  aellmmomisoem  (EIIBODMERBEODI]  @B0Bqc0d
M@  ©OMIGatoemMmilenileilgl  (lagaV.ed) anendled  dlmile  eidls)
(MoROQIMEUD;

(andl) an @RUULOTIERI0e0D] eidla) MUeaendavdatdle] @y@:d:e8d
DeROME:ILI0 MVoERIAIMEES0;

(o)) avdeeoad mldegutlesimm acgomeleno @@@U.
(3) an6NE @S9 JO@IM EDIUDIEEBRUBEOD],—

(ag) moeilmieEngles caudoldleadm, euwealdemo, VDIV,
aI@laloeiMo, MoMiE:06Mo, MIBEMIdemEIMo ag)aI! DUBE OSDISS, ag)MOTS oi@d
@0 IBIHMSSIOTOOD, ag)go BORIMITIMIE0eM (IQIBTMMEBRUBL)]0;

(enil) S00IRHAROQ) @eflmniremi@eemamImoniuosaom
DalHOEMEBRUB AUOBRIMGIMIo unda leepmna@iimnio;

(@) avellmyrvemie:oemoaml@  ogdeqsldleaan  sflaimestoes
@slage @rdlage  aldellylesymailmeasndalss  aidludlemodimge @005l
Qll&am aidlatosle:udee)o;

(@) d0ed @rUlle:dla) @melmymemisosmanmall enicnweals
DEQOMBIL0 (aINIBTDMEIBUBBN]0

9aICOUNIGHOERMIEM.”.

: jlay o Y) o] €21880@.—Iwom aedlen
335-20 ojae,gr&jlmgmca,coo @289 JOIAM QUdhla] mmdmm@osm, @RIV O —

“335.40 OS®Jo  QI0EMIEAL  aVN03a I 1M YOI () ) (1) oY) |
edleanamalmgs  oomoodldie—(1) @060  &HSWESD  Qosmle
0% INOBISMP@L0 aldlTee alo@lmonll quye:slesssnzmio @O aldlToED)

- @oeilmpe  aelleogdloy@ewo ®mB8BG:EWO  HOVION@®EWO  H2IYOTIBLeLEDLo
GRepEIc @@l aidlmuoo «gemsleyoe aoellmie aeflesclwoemo mssiemo

: This is a digitally signed Gazette.
| Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

SHOMIHBHNHOEMO 9 IGRISTNLNOS @pmyaiclenomloleae:mio 6.21CRYENRO)

9SAWIHSEWO HIEGAUNBHNVHMPEWO OGS M@OIBleanmM@mosm).

(2) (1)-00 Qaltidlaflon QAIMOGUS c@omeslene @RUd eloceil sy

GENIDWIRR SO, (IO  LlCLINOMIONG  EMOC®O  VOQIEDO  (V|ERINIGAD
@RMMVE)a] OTVE@SOIEE60, HAVESO] (@ IEDG0 2BAMEINSIOMID DEROWTUOEMO
TROM0o ARVOS CGAG GOYIVI0o Bl @RS ail® 2paCmoQRM@I6.

(3) (2)00 Salidlafel®H000 2RAOMESISISS oile, GRG apacBIi®
ool 0@ adolmed  dlamomlimssiad  ERSWELeTE™e  @R(E1E:000
@RsDVLM@ID afl®al QIOIEODI@OM, HAVEESOI, @PIWBSLOTIN af)SILEARMN BY
MSaISlGWBE8  @oo  AEOO®  AlWOMI@,  GEMUGaHM  MSalsSle:ud
@RDoREIBHHENZMAOEM).

ollvodleoemoe—® aiGkflo @pasiTTleeIea®l, '@Seud, ‘aemley
M0%alMo’ oM QOENGHWRS  @INX@o  1960-081  EHO8  HSHSBYo
QIoeMlgRuNda IMeEngle @RGGIcd (1960-0e1 34) @RITes M@slTIgss aoem
@RAMOERUD emRololeamamos).”.

HOT—( 1WOM @GO 337-00
QU)o {lNa Do IS aIODIM O_Iﬁ&oﬂj cajcéccaasna@osm @RIV —

“337.9216@000a)  ©QISS0 S lD@IVORIERSICRICHD  SRLI0UDDEIRSIELICHN0
S8969) MV GSR@.—(1) WOSHDmIVIBLo a@BOMSAIER0 MU, 210M, HMIFIMD), GaNISTD,
oequooad, ofls, QIAIMO® MNdaIMo, @BV I ERERIBIC ag MUNdeIMERUd
agmludl®d mlmss aellmeeio, ©a0®] @RREN2IENG:UD, 60O, emOAl,
PalOMVOLIo, 2RI @RORIBIC 23e1m0d(Pe ag)mlnilsanglenlss) aeIeeGEWO
R91ENNAINB @RMQIGIENGEWI EROLIBIT @O0 aldlcvesnglcd mlan @romo
9016@0UNs] ©AUSSe @NEeNAPM  @RMAIGleN@EO  @RegIEI®  @RGIM]
EHDDEMNIBLEHEWI 6)alQIM o I0SIgIOmDmOs).

(2) ()00 Palaidqflos aoITUNSUd eloceiloenm aBO®OOISIOMR@30
@ OMESOes @REWIte VIR EGOWOMDD MM ERMIGIMOTI0o
0} V@D S0l@oem®AI® alle alB@mOQRM@IE.

(3) emu@sOles, a@em®iele ©ald®] GOOWIEEIESeD SISTIGLIGHO
oonillenieesd @ReRIE@ 2EQe®BILRe  BaldMMOLICMESND  @RORJEHIGD
®meuangceIees0 nellmmel a9le:0m @RMAIEIEaNM God®slele ©6niGafo
syeenio @regielm aegemeilele @03(RER0 @RSWANAOEMO AJSIAIEMO GRORIBIG
lose ©algpanemd emMOSINY MEIM GROMOe  AIClVECDISNE OSHEWIESI
HOBNINDBEDEMIESO MIBEGUTIEHOARN@IE).

(4) (3)-00 2alidla Ble00mas MIdeGUdo LIEla) a@e@O0IBL0 mldeguoo
eidlaj o@¢ dlaiomimsslad @romoe MIdeguosanud aeillessemmie @REMOC

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

mldeguosanud  amellegymoia® @pwowd alldalioyomiloom, eavuesol, (2)-0
9alaldla] (@000 Mfl&alescanm o@om®leRe MSalSIeudes Goo QIEISM,
@ROMOo ©8ale], Sueni G@RegElad ag M0BWRERUD EPSTVONGEDO MISIHEWO
@ReRIEI@ (7186 H2IGRBHEWI H2ICQENEMIe MM calens] QIO @LNOAOL .alelal
@Ol Moo DVSIEHOENZMMO6M.”.

16. 340-00 QIdIfl0) 0ld@0 oGl Qidle] €a1BLOM.—(@lwom apadlee

340-% QI flol ald:00 @089 JO@IMN Qld:la] B2IBELRENEMIEN), BROIWD:—

“340. ©alo®MAVOLIEBRSIGLICH0  qUIHHO0Y quoeicssilenieosn aoellmio
aleileqdlonmalmiss  dleeowmoe.—(1) aeilmie msimaimeatsdl 9e3udleeeq]s

qupoeisgloendlos  omojaileen @ISWIEED Oa@IMORIEOTO  IOMIVIBLo
a@ommslege  @oellme  aellescdlayeemo  alellogdlenss  QIODES:SO8eE:6@0
OEBSHEWO HOTNONGHEWO HFlaf} BISIHEWO GRORIBIG EROMVo (IQIOTIG:UD
©2IgRM@INT @:006MBONIBE@O §)21QOND o 10SlePCm@OEN.

(2) mldepalajlgissoy @Eieooend @regElm aME@SOl ooeesi0lla
MldeguoeERUd  @EMIVAIEL0 @RRPOMm DISEINIBlo  ABOMEHLo  TVJBO0S
auoelenglad  aoellnpe  aellosjdloysewo  arllesdlens  lowled S0
OS[HEWO  HOMIBNGHEWO @Fla)l MSIBHEWO TOORBITD CPOMOO (IO
©2IQRIM@INT E006MABOAGEDO 62RO o I0SIRIOTH@OEN.

(3 (D00 galsiefeeieo (2)-00 galaidle{locic@o  aKQINUOGUD
oBoomilege @Ud  elepilapeaiy  GMNIWRNISIM, EINOY®  elceimomiond
GMIGMO  NDOQIGDD  (VJROAIEAD  @PMITLGLL] BIVESOIeEs  &IVESTl oo
@RAIDIOMIEEIEN0D]  (EICMIG0 @RWIG:000S;OMI®  SERPWAVOEMO GBRAEMDO
@SOS CAM M@DIVADo BRQYIWI0o Ve IAIO® @RS ail® aadmoamM @Oy

(4) (3)00 Palaida] @I5000 ARAODER]S oil® @R apaoo Cloo)
o@D aldlme! dlamomlmesicd Grswesnememle @REIG:000 BRSWENMOIGD
afléal a0, eMESOl, @EWIBELODIOD fSIENARM  o@eOmBleRo
MNSalSl@:U3AE) Rollo AMIOD, G IdTUlG: UM MSalSle:td @ROEESeEIROIMIENS.”.

17. 340ag) Q1o Il 01600 o DD Qldsla] E2IBLOM.—@iwom @radlen: 340ag)
Qi flol ale:00 @069q JOIM Qldsla] Gmdmmoaﬁ BRMOIWD).—

“340@_ moailmgcsmo alQIGOD m'}cmcbgea; QUM MENESO _LEIDUDWEBRSILI0

] 1Mo ) . —(1) @oe®IDI8)o Saltd®)
me:moc&taco‘rm’lcmo aaelouocmcam’}mem melcmocmcpélcmo @oeillmyend alaieno allrvdees
amioeacsd alellesjolweed ME88)e:e@0 ardlceles nellmestlo B9IE6GE0
a@oOO®Blele SO mIM) @RGIERIOs OQISSe GG  @RMNIGIEENEEO
@negiBl@  aellmmelo  @ROIGEISS 93HOM  @RMIIESN®HEWI, NEQEGBe]o
aflwomlad seio PelMR006}E:EWO @ROLIBI, RO &O} (EIAKOD SalQM G

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala_gov.in/




14

QoeteWBlee  mModlemeed  mleoulem@emo mideniauwles@ewo
8010l [l06)B6@0 219 aldSIpjoTmmOs.

(2) (1)-%0 2al0ida] EISHOONSS B0} BiQo eeaNMIlenilgle om0
sopjoom@RD]clesnm@moen.

(3) (1)-90 2alid)afldd «10OABUWTIENM @:)Qo S2IQRM oGOMOVOBLo
SIQNO0INOTIED@  aIBIMODI0e O IDIM SOV @RABaIBIMIIoo
0ol @alloem@MSS o lewlo @O HOTVATIT BJOWISBWIo B0} AUBHOMITD
S0ll@oam@M8s Msalle M@ uBledleesqjesenzmasm.”.

18. 3406nil Q1a I 01800 « PO Qldh)a] E21BLOM.—(aIwom ee:glee: 340anil
Qe {l) aldh 0o MO ODIM Qld:)a] C2IBELOENZDMOE), GRMOW®).—

“340enil. @oellmiemo  ollnERROINTOILHEHED  635:06112]Ga 10N
2016200lla)  QI0e0Me allSloqisieoeie  oenaedselo—(1) 0D @RRVPVOWIT
SFlenss a0} QM S2IPRMOIMSS EGUDIETMINSEWD BO}ENETTIESEWO
aceflmiean  allaudmery  AINTOREOESD  HaldOMOLIODIERHSEWO  Salo@MIRGDI
BIOSEWI  SHSTMINGINZCaIOGIMEMO @RIOAD @RE L3000  MledHa leeymailad
90160 5J@INEUDaHo GIBIOG: CGalOBMEMO @RHEMAT MRV Moud@lOed
SI0EMAIBS &0) QPOMOTD GROLIBIT VOIM@OTD, OAVESOleo D
@RAIODTIEEIe0W]  BIVES0l  @PUWl@:008SiEmI  mdlmdlapeilglalios ey
9eapUMOEMo, aueni HDMIMSalgMNeSs aldalolm@ @owem &0 Gakellmd
oesEwM0emo  afldlasjsieeeemml, crwlaocdlmes aquenl  wlallaemad
2=ldeE) B0 l0ed aNITROICHNENZMAIEI).

(2) @GREMHEMOTTINT GUDaHo, DD GRELIOAMIM eSS BeOmeslelo
BIQOIOIERUE  aIQPMB  QaNMo @PERIBI WOMalN@o  QaleoUllaflgiesnzay
oflojnilesond mp@aow  @coemaeezarn  qusni  alallatem@d  asdlomiesglad
GENIWIE|SOT, @REReM  ollSlOsS}Om  QadMe  @EEERIBICE  @WOMeld@o
BEMROGSOARMN @0, GRLIOTMald:Ho, B allgimadesenzmnosm).

(3) APLOMOTIOHMMERO WOMD@OMINNdeO 2SAVELN0 @RORIEITE
@ROI@ MlmMoeemo @R «ilSIeaiSIOMT) @RAIBLE—

@) QNMERD  @OMal)(@ERD  HENFOHZOM  SO06MAIW
MonM:eseadla] @PWOSS coaodele G@ROIDlspesienE o) emoslay
N 0OHDMW]0; DHSOOHD -

(i) BSENOSIPMSS S0MOMIOMBIO, emoslavlad
QASMDOSSHVISISS MPRROD  MVAROHIMSSIT, CPWIWBHS A IOWIQIMISIO)
A I0@QIB MPWAIW G@RAKTVB0 NMBBIHHWo .

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




15

D QIdla] @18:000 a@OMBIER0 QI0NMEND WOMAINMEAO HENESBHSIMSS DOMOOT
al}06q]s30ileem atoslgloammosn).

(4) adlslosjsiom aenm@vlesd @oma@asilean noeflmiend a1nIend
@oegil@®  allivdmeens 988 qUMAREBSITE,  QI0AOMERD  WOIMaD@ERD
aflslegjsiemm @3, @PEGne BTV SOILeRIBITE, @OMO. alldleasieecd osd
om@silow anolaleessnzmlo, MY @PERLPVOTIM @  ogSIEeoAM
a@OOMBIEo MSaISIBUBEE Goto QINB®, AUOMOTIHMPEWO WM @OHIOFEWO
2s0@es ealelnilad moellme, 21018 @regEl@ allnudesieanud alless ealgumailad
omE@s0l Mmsaisl mujledlessenzmle wamem alese eaguM@IMSs  ealeiaRe
@QOWleo OpIfl@d  salwoom  allele  emuE@sdl  osadl@d  mlange
EDDSIBLSEZMAIEN),

(5) aLanOMERd WOMal(@ERD oa.srrags)ce,g;(m MoV @R Gelelo
£2l6QENMEMIe @REBOM LIElONM oS @0elmiTcmie:06m anendleriss aioal
QI BHENROAEM.”.

19. 345-00 QIde MBS GERRNEIL.—( IWOM ABG:GlOe! 345-00 it I3, “@Go@Oud,
3400 aeleflond dlWloI®  9uwdeq simlgpeelcd”  a)0M  QRESBUWBE6}0

aflam@wilmye GRSOODMIMe ERAUOTIMIe old:do “GRWIUBHE), DD @RELPDVODIGD

26QoaIsomle Wle:ueOMle M@BSIWIFlpPewsl@” ag)m anea@®8le aflamao
G2lBBHNEMOET).

20. 345ag) o) o RO QIB:}a] G2IBHO@.—(IWOM @RGFlee! 345-00 Qi)Yo flay
€UDatHo MIOF [OWIMN Qld:le] E2lBELEENZMOEN, BRMOWD):—

“3459(). olil® anA@ORAN@ quosniaUla) aKQINNOGU.—(1) 340-00 Qidafleno
340 ogy aldaflelo a1000dwWlaflgiss Weuswd adloswiss oY GreLPGDIND

Slslarl @Iemoo} olle@io—

() @O 2BAOMOM BHOOEMBOW  MVNMNGOBLNOla] @P@OSS
GE6UOM Ll @Ol 2)6)8:06ME 630} BMOSIMT MEB0OMDY0; B1SOOD

(ii) @RO  2RACVOMBS - HOVEMOTIONTIOD,  emoSlavlad
 QSOLSIDIF88 MP@AOD  MEROMIMSSI@, @EWIRBES @ I0WIUMSST
alO@IQIND &0} @RAITVOL NTBHIHDM Yo :

OIVE:S0] 2RO aloslgloammosn.

(2) (D-00 alaide] @I&000 afle Mlunidilemm qondlaglad, eauwsol
@ol@d  pudeq sldlemm adelmiomilend aleqajo @regEl® @ogal, ofls, eanosa,
QIQINO®o, AY MO0 IMEBRUD aIMIIDOS Mo, QIR o, TLOIMo, GISIOD TVAHOB
woleelnencdll  2eNLHMBEmO 206 |SICleaMEm EP® wGo®®ileRe 21SERUD
anegls:lad m0dQMIBe3ueERUd GemaslarIS)eaaeEmos.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

(3) DY @EPELPDOWIM SAD 2BAOMIM GO0} allewlo 538 enil
U@  a10003Wlafl§88  (@Ie000 SIS  HSIFBHODM  Galsel
EDVSOCHOENZMOENM.”.

21..509-20 Qi BREVD].—(IWIM @REGIeel 509-00 Qldsle lad,— -

() (1)-90 Dald: i@ “390” agyn @REOOWIN) Madal “326al, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)0M GBRLOEERS)o @RGHUOo 2llaMEERS)0 G2IBCLOENZEIE);

(ii) (6)-00 @aiB}o @ “390” agym @REOODI BBal “326a0, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)(M @RBOEBRSo GRAHHUOA0 2ilaMEBRS)0 GalBCLNERMOE);

(iii) (7)-%0 DalQide @ “390” ag)M @REO@IM @Bai “326al, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag) @REHEENRSo GRSHUOA0 aflaNEENRBo C2IBELSSTZDOE).

22. 565-00 Qidhlo 0188 6RENMN.—(EIWOm @ra:dleel 565-00 Qi flad,—

(i) (2)00 Palaidle @ (@} EUEMLOMIMNIEUDHO GINPQOWIAM EUEMDEBRUD
G2lBBHBHENZMIE), BRMOIWD):—

“(afl) @revP@o XViagy @ alemaeslwlgiss aoellmimiomie.oem
aR@ow eNITWe s Qils@eanud; :

(wegyy) 1986-0e1 aiolaudlol .(m.)o(DdBﬂdGTn) @&glmie (1986-e01 29-00
B3 BRSY) AP S0 Den0eslwlgss alganuiese allewwacdll mldemoem-
ealgleed noellmieanud, e-moellmieanud, wojallel @oellmieEanud, @ISO
noBasle: moellmieanud, oloqylss moeillmeanud, EaImoelmiERUd  agmlci@iaowsl
ENITWEN g QllaH@EBRUD.”; :

(ii) (4)-% DalOldfl@d “@RETMS B} IGWOB” af)M AUOBERD:UBH6) ald:0o
" ITIMOD]00 B ICIBS" o) QADEEUD @aIBESHENZMIE).

23. 570-00 QId:30 MBS GERENMI.—(EIWIM @RE:Fleel 570-00 Qe fl@d,—

(i) (ag) QUEMLODI@ “ERETMO} B IEWIBO” af)MN QAUILENEUBBE aldh®o
“alMNOI0e  @ICWIBe”  af)M  QDSNGSBlo “GRMIM} 0leWIBo” o)
QBN BUDEE ald:@o “EOIMNIO O} IEWIBo™ ag)(M QUOONB:SJo C2l@BLRENRMIE;

(ii) (eni) euEMLEOMIT “GPMIM} OJICWIBo” AN QUILNBUBSLS ald:0o
"eDDIMNIO BJaIEWOG" o) (UOSE]EHUD B2IBBSSETIZMOE).

24. 57200 Qi lmIss EREUWOI—(EIWom. Gra:Gleel 572-00 aida] (1)-00
DalQidslo @3, “TMBEe0B” oM QRO  GUWaHo, “@regiEl@  qVALeA
@PUE008SIOMI® DEROWAVNME” ag)N AUCOS}E:UD CalGEHOENEMIET).

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

25. ML oiSleDienss @EEND.—(I1UW0m @R&Qleel Moo  alSle:@lcd
"QVOWOREM UBlEHBUD" ag)M UBlRaHBODIMBBISIED (1)-00 G508V, —

(1) 253-00 Qe flomdlen (3)-00 eeosomI@®, “emovlengle:giaswio agle
eflqy avadejlesymalad oll¥al  AGEMM@INT” o) AUOLNGUWBLS  ald:0o
“U00aIMEBRUB MIMEIWAUMIOS Gald)N@HIMMIM afldal aioyommM@Ia” agyam
QIDBNUD BaldeLeENEMIEN),

(i) 335-00 QB lOoNTlO0,—

(a@) (3)00 GHISOWIM “DyNUDQIERSe alQING@lo  @oellmieEns)o
@oMlallmnow  JOIDI®  ©65:eQRFemM@”  af)M  QPONGUWDES  alddo
“@SHBIOSWYo QUOEMIEAVN0 INEEBRBIHSDIo alBlOo AT TVGHlEHIMISs
DOMOAUIEIM0” ag)N QAUIBENG:UD GaIBCHOENRMIEN);

(enil) (4)-00 €HOSOMIMD “@RETMG BYal” afON QAUOBOBUDLS aldh®o
“aI®INIDIDo Bat” ag)M QDLW  GaldCReMRMIeNY;

(i) 337-00 Qidloflo, @PGIOMTIGOWES (3), (4) gy Gaoémg'lam
92u1dae)0la JB:8l0 B¥laesaMRmIENTY;

(iv) 339-00 Qidloflomadilon (4)-00 e8I “eEMIG] @RI Olat” ag)m
QUIBNUDARE) ald®o “BRQIWID0 BJat” ag)M QAUOBEGUD GaIGCSRENEZMIENT;

(v) 34000 aspflommleo (4)-00 e8I “Oenzodloe ©}l” ag)am
QOENGUBES) ald:®0 "al®IMNOD]I0o Bal” ag)(N QDEEGUD GaIBGHSERMIE,;

(vi) 492-00 Qidjeflom@Ien (2)-00 EBHISOBI@ “2” g)aD EROOOTI ald:do
“12” ag)0mn @RE0 GalBGHOENZMIE).

26. ogoseene avlonesele.—(1) 2023-ea1 ea0s mmialajoeld (eeawai)

eodalmaday ( 2023-ee1 3) @IMO®d 0gosslaldlesa;.

(2) @remem 0308WIOMIMOMHMM @0 (EITV@® &3WIMNMM (Id:000
GRENOI 92IQe]S (WM ERBGIIVBHIFI® OUDT® aGOMBIEe G:00EA ag)SIOD
a@eoElelo MSalSleo, MV @RBY (ISH000 BGRENOY 02lQeals  (IWOM
ARSFMBIFITE ©2ITOH@ICWO af)SIOMDOCWI B0} ESENRMIEN).

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department
NOTIFICATION
No. 64/Leg.C1/2023/Law. ' Dated, ]hirm:anmrthapuram, 2nd March, 2024

18th Kumbham, 1199
[2th Phalguna, 1945.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Act, 2024 (6 of 2024).

By order of the Governor,

C. VIJAYA LAKSHMI,
Special Secretary (Law).

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




-

19

[Translation in English of “2024-e£1 e@08 mymimilajoeilgl (¢cev@]) @e:q” published under
the authority of the Governor.]

ACT 6 OF 2024
THE KERALA MUNICIPALITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2024

An
Act

Jfurther to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act,1994
of for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Seventy-fifth year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement —(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Municipality
( Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) Items (i) and (vi) of section 25 shall come into force at once and the remaining
sections shall be deemed to have come into force on the 9 day of December, 2023.

2. Amendment of section 58—In the Kerala Municipality Act,1994 (20 of 1994)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in sub-section (1) of section 58 of the principal
Act, after the words and symbol “welfare programmes,” the words and symbol “waste
management,” shall be inserted.

3. Insertion of Chapter XVIA—After section 325 of the principal Act and above the
heading “Management of waste ” ,“CHAPTER XVIA” shall be inserted.

4, Insertion of new section 325A.—In the principal Act, after the heading
“CHAPTER XVIA, Management of waste”, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“325A. Definition—For the purpose of this chapter and section 58, “waste
management” means the segregation, collection, transportation, storage, processing or disposal
of waste, including solid waste.

Explanation—Words and expressions used in this chapter and not defined, but
defined in the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made
thereunder, shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the said Act and the
rules.”.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala gov.in/




20

5. Amendment of section 326.—In section 326 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1a), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1a) All the duties, responsibilities and functions of the municipality pertaining
to waste management as provided in this chapter and the rules made under this Act, and in the
Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made thereunder,
shall vest with the council, and the council shall discharge its duties, responsibilities and
functions through the Secretary.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1a), so substituted, the following sub-section, shall be inserted,
namely:— ‘

“(1aa) It shall be the responsibility of the Secretary to discharge the duties,
responsibilities and functions of the Municipality under sub-section (1a), and the Secretary may
by order in writing entrust the said duties to officers and employees having the charge of waste
management, public health, sanitation and engineering or any other officers or employees of
the Municipality, on the basis of streets or areas or the nature of work, and ensure that such
duties, responsibilities and functions are duly discharged by them.”.

(iii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The Municipality may directly or through any person or agency or on contract basis
or otherwise, make arrangements in whole or in part, for carrying out waste management
activities under this Act and the rules made thereunder or the Environment (Protection) Act,
1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”.

6. Insertion of new sections afier section 326.—After section 326 of the principal Act,
the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“326 A. Council to carry out Government directions.—(1) It shall be the
responsibility of the Council to carry out directions issued by the Government in pursuance of
the solid waste management under this Act or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986
(Central Act 29 of 1986) or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Chairperson shall ensure that the agenda prepared in connection with
the directions issued under sub-section (1) is placed before the Council in its next meeting and
the Council shall take decision on such agenda .

(3) In cases where the Council fails to take decision in accordance with the
directions issued under sub-section (1) within one month of the receipt of the same, it shall be
deemed that permission for carrying out such directions has been approved or given by the
Council.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

(4) The Secretary shall immediately take steps to implement such decisions,
including the deemed approval under sub-section (3), and if there is any failure or default by
the Secretary or any other responsible officer in implementing such decision, the Government
may initiate disciplinary action against the Secretary or such officer, considering it as
dereliction of duty.

(5) If the Council fails to comply with the directions of the Government under
sub-section (1), the Government may, impose fine on the Council, without prejudice to any
other actions that may be initiated against the Council:

Provided that a reasonable opportunity of being heard shall be given to the Council
before imposing the said fine.

326B. Responsibilities of Secretary on waste management.—(1) The Secretary may
initiate legal actions against any person who contravenes the provisions of this chapter and may
compound offences which are compoundable under this Act or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Secretary shall have all the powers for effectively carrying out the
responsibilities regarding the waste management under this chapter or any other law for the
time being in force.

(3) The Secretary may, in exigencies after informing the chairperson, expend an
amount not exceeding two lakh rupees out of the municipal fund concerned, for discharging
the functions vested with him under this chapter or any other law for the time being in force
relating to waste management.

326C. Responsibility to handover segregated waste to the Municipality or authorised
agency—(1) It shall be the responsibility of every household, owners, occupiers of any
premises, hotel, restaurant, industry, hospital or any other establishment to hand over or deposit
segregated waste in the designated location and pay the user fee to the municipality or
authorised agency as directed by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand
rupees but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (1).

326D. Provisions relating to user fee—(1) Each Municipality shall fix a user fee, to
meet the whole or part of the cost for providing services in connection with segregation, -
collection, transportation, storage, processing and disposal of waste on every waste generator
and collect the same in the manner as may be specified by the municipality:

Provided that if the Government have fixed the rate for user fee, the Council shall
not fix a rate less than the rate fixed by the Government.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

(2) Each waste generator shall pay the user fee to the Municipality or to any
authorised agency before the last date of every month or within such period as may be decided
by the Municipality.

(3) If any waste generator fails to pay the user fee as provided under sub-section
(2), it shall be recovered, together with fine at the rate of fifty percent per month:

Provided that such fine shall be recovered only where such user fee has not been
remitted even after the expiry of ninety days from the specified date.

(4) The user fee together with the fine shall be recovered as arrears of public
revenue as specified in section 538 B.

(5) The Secretary, without prejudice to any other action that may be taken
against the defaulter of the user fee, may refuse to provide any service from the Municipality
to such defaulter until the user fee is paid.

(6) The Government or in accordance with the guidelines as may be issued by
the Government from time to time, the Municipality may, exempt any waste generator or class
of waste generators or owners or occupiers of any unoccupied or vacant buildings, from the
payment of user fee in whole or in part .”.

7. Substitution of new section for section 327 —For section 327 of the principal Act, the
following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“327. Duties of waste generators for storage and deposit of solid waste—(1) It shall
be the duty of each waste generator to provide separate bins or receptacles of the size and colour,
as may be prescribed in the rules or bye laws or as may be specified by the Secretary, for the
purpose of storage of biodegradable, non-biodegradable and domestic hazardous waste.

(2) Such bins or receptacles shall always be kept in good condition and shall be
provided in such numbers and at such places as the Secretary may, from time to time, direct by
public notice.

(3) Each waste generator shall segregate and deposit the waste, as specified in
the rules or bye laws, for easy collection and disposal of such waste by the employees or
contractors engaged by the Municipality.

(4) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand
rupees but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (3).”.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

8. Amendment of section 328.—In section 328 of the principal Act,—

(i) for the marginal heading the following marginal heading shall be substituted,
namely:—

“Contract with waste generator or owner or occupier for the removal of waste”;

(ii) in the existing provision, for the words “the owner or occupier of any premises
to remove rubbish or filth”, the words “the waste generator or owner or occupier of any
premises for the removal of waste” shall be substituted.

9. Substitution of new section for section 329.—For section 329 of the principal Act, the
following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“329. Door to door collection of waste.—(1) Each Municipality, in the municipal
area, shall arrange door to door collection of segregated waste from all households, settlements,
commercial institutions and other non-residential premises and in the case of multi-storied
buildings, commercial complexes, malls, housing complexes etc. from the entry gate or any
other location as may be specified by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) Segregated waste collected as per sub-section (1) shiall not be transported or
brought for treatment or disposal unless it is properly covered .”.

10. Amendment of section 331.—In section 331 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) A Municipality that does not have a solid, liquid, sewage or faecal sludgé
treatment plant but possess vacant land within or outside the municipal area shall undertake
projects for the setting up of such plants or facilities on the said land on top priority.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1), so substituted, the following sub-sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1a) Each Municipality shall identify suitable private land within or outside the
municipal area for the purpose of waste management, if necessary, acquire the land under the
Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (Central Act 30 of 2013) or by land relinquishment or on lease or
through private purchase.

(1b) The land acquired by the Municipality under the sub-section (1a) shall not be
used for any other purpose without the prior sanction of the Government.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

(1c) Each Municipality shall give priority to utilise its own vacant land or land
vested in it for waste management activities where the land is available for the same.

(1d) The Municipality shall take all possible steps to resume waste management
activities on the land, which was previously utilized for such activities but remains unused
due to various reasons:

Provided that such land shall not be diverted or utilised for any other purposes or
activities without prior sanction of the Government.”;

(1i1) in sub-section (2), for the words, symbol, bracket and figure “notifying the land
under sub-section (1)”, the words, symbol, bracket, figure and letter “identifying the land
under sub-section (1a) shall be substituted.

11. Insertion of new sections after section 332 —After section 332 of the principal Act,
the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“332A. Setting up of joint waste management projects.—The Municipality may, if
the Council so decides or if so required by the Government, set up joint waste management
projects with any other Local Self Government Institution on such terms and conditions, as
may be agreed by such Local Self Government Institutions, subject to the guidelines as may
be issued by the Government in this regard.

332B. Municipality to make arrangement for conducting regular inspection and
monitoring—It shall be the responsibility of the municipality to make arrangements for
conducting regular inspections and monitoring of the waste management activities and
projects in the municipality to ensure that it is being operated or implemented in compliance
with the required standards and in accordance with the relevant laws.

332C. Responsibilities of individuals and rewards for reporting offences —(1) Any
person may report before the Secretary regarding any violation of the provisions in this
chapter or any offence relating to waste management, including littering, dumping or throwing
waste into public places and water bodies.

(2) Subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the Government, from time
to time, the Municipality may give rewards to persons who report violations and offences
under sub-section (1).

(3) Any person who maliciously or intentionally makes a false report under
sub-section (1) to harm or cause loss to another person shall, on conviction, be punished with
fine which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

332D. Beneficial provisions for residents near to waste treatment Centres—(1) The
Municipality may, subject to the rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the
Government, provide incentives, including but not limited to tax exemptions or relaxations or

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala.gov.in/




r
|

25

welfare schemes to the residing in the immediate vicinity of centralised waste treatment
centres or disposal sites.

(2) The Municipality may establish convenient and beneficial facilities such as
parks, playgrounds, recycling facilities, swap shops and physical training facilities, for the
well-being and recreational opportunities of the residents in the vicinity of centralised waste
treatment centres or disposal sites.”.

12. Amendment of section 333.—In section 333 of the principal Act, the existing
provision shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) so numbered,
the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) No person shall organise an event or gathering of more than one hundred
persons at any unlicensed place without intimating the Municipality, at least three working
days in advance and such person or the organiser of such event shall ensure segregation of
waste at source and handing over of the same to the waste collector or agency as specified by
the Municipality on such fees as may be fixed by the Municipality:

Provided that such fees shall not be less than the actual rate of cost for the management
of such waste and the same shall be paid in advance as directed by Municipality.”.

13. Substitution of new section for section 334 C —For section 334 C of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“334C. Constitution of Waste Management Fund.—(1) Each Municipality shall
constitute a fund, by name, “Waste Management Fund”, and it shall be managed in
accordance with the rules made or guidelines issued by the Government .

(2) The following shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund, namely:—

(a) amounts recovered as fine or penalty in connection with violations of
waste management;

(b) contributions received from Corporate Social Responsibility (CSR)
funds for the purpose of waste management;

(c) sponsorship amounts or any other contributions received for this purpose;
(d) any other amount as specified by the Government.
(3) The Fund shall be utilised for the following purposes,—

(a) all waste management activities, including but not limited to segregation,
collection, transportation, management, processing, disposal of waste etc;

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




26

(b) purchase and installation of equipments necessary for effective waste
management;

(c) training and capacity development programmes to enhance the skills and
knowledge of employees engaged in waste management;

(d) any other activities related to waste management as approved by the
Government.”.

14. Substitution of new section for section 335.—For section 335 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:— :

“335. Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments
clean—1) It shall be the responsibility of the owner or occupier of each shop and
commercial establishment to keep its premises clean and not to throw, litter, deposit or burn
any waste on its premises or allow customers to throw, litter, deposit or burn any waste on its
premises.

(2) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary may, on
being satisfied that any person has violated the provisions in sub-section (1), impose on such
person a fine which may extend to five thousand rupees on the basis of extent, gravity and
nature of the said violation. :

(3) The fine imposed under sub-section (2) shall be remitted within fifteen days
from the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate
prosecution proceedings without prejudice to any other actions that may be taken against him.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, the words ‘shops’, ‘commercial
establishment’ shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the Kerala
Shops and Commercial Establishments Act,1960 ( 34 of 1960).”.

15. Substitution of new section for section 337 —For section 337 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“337. Prohibition of draining of used water into public places or water bodies —(1) No
person shall drain or allow to drain waste water from any sink, drain, stable, hotel, restaurant,
household, industry, hospital or other establishment into any public drain, road, street or
public place or water body or water course or allow or cause to drain such used water out of
such premises.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than five thousand
rupees but not exceeding fifty thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (1).

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




27

. (3) The Secretary may, by notice, direct the owner or occupier of such premises
to close or shut or remove any pipe or tube or other means by which used water is allowed to
flow into any public road, drain or street or any other public place or water bodies.

(4) Any person who has been given a direction under sub-section (3) shall
comply with such directions within a period of seven days of its receipt and if he fails to
comply with such directions, the Secretary shall, without prejudice to the actions that may be
taken under sub-section (2), close, shut or remove such pipe, tube or other means and shall
recover the actual expenditure incurred for such removal from him.”.

16. Substitution of new section for section 340.—For section 340 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:.—

“340. Prohibition of throwing waste into public places or private places.—(1) No
person shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste on any street, drain or public place
that is not intended for such use, or caused such acts to be done.

(2) No person shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste in any private
places or caused to do such act, otherwise as prescribed or in accordance with the directions
issued by the Secretary.

(3) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the
purpose may, on being satisfied that any person who has violated the provisions in
sub-sections (1) or (2), impose on such person on the spot, a fine which may extend to five
thousand rupees on the basis of extent, gravity and nature of the said violation.

(4) The fine imposed under sub-section (3) shall be remitted within fifteen days
from the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate

prosecution proceedings, without prejudice to any other action which may be taken against
him'77‘

17. Substitution of new section for section 3404.—For section 340 A of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340A. Prohibition of depositing waste or rubbish or excreta in water bodies and
water sources.—(1) No person shall throw or deposit waste or rubbish or excreta in a water
course, water body or water source or allow or cause to flow water from any latrine or allow
waste water to flow into it or pollute the water in any other way or engage or depute or
compel or instigate any person to do such activity.

(2) An offence under sub-section (1) shall be cognizable and non-bailable.

(3) Whoever commits an offence referred to in sub-section (1), shall, on
conviction, be punishable with fine which shall not be less than ten thousand rupees but not

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




28

exceeding fifty thousand rupees and with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than
six months but not exceeding one year.”.

18. Substitution of new section for section 340 B.—For section 340 B of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340B. Seizure and confiscation of the vehicle used for carrying waste or
excreta—(1) The Secretary or an officer of the Municipality authorised by the Secretary in
this behalf or a Police Officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector shall seize a vehicle or
vessel carrying waste or excreta through public place or public road with the intention or
preparation to commit an offence under this chapter or having reasonable cause to suspect that
the vehicle or vessel is on its return after being used for such deposit, and shall produce
before the Sub Divisional Magistrate having jurisdiction.

(2) After conducting inquiry, if the Sub Divisional Magistrate is satisfied that
there is reasonable ground to believe that the vehicle or vessel has been used for committing
any offences under this chapter, the vehicle or vessel so seized may be confiscated, and in any
other case, it shall be released.

(3) No order confiscating any vehicle or vessel shall be made under this section
unless the owner of such vehicle or vessel or the person from whom it is seized,—

(i) is given a notice in writing informing him, the grounds on which the
vehicle or vessel is to be confiscated; and

(it) is given an opportunity of being heard against the ground of confiscation
within such reasonable time as may be specified in the notice.

(4) In cases where the vehicle or vessel seized contains waste, rubbish or
excreta, the person seizing the vehicle or vessel, if he is not the Secretary, shall immediately
inform the Secretary of such seizure, and the Secretary shall, without prejudice to any actions
that may be taken under this chapter, take step to dispose of such waste, rubbish or excreta at
the expense of the owner of the vehicle or vessel, and the Secretary shall recover the cost of
such disposal together with a fine not exceeding five thousand rupees from the owner.

(5) Where the vehicle or vessel is confiscated, it shall be auctioned and the
amount so received shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund.”.

19. Amendment of section 345.—In section 345 of the principal Act, for the words,
figure and letter “and which does not fall under the purview of section 340A”, the words “for
which no punishment is provided elsewhere in this chapter” shall be substituted.

20. Insertion of new section 3454 —After section 345 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely:—

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala. gov.in/




29

“345A. Provisions regarding imposition of fine—(1) No fine under this chapter,
except penalty specified in sections 340 and 340A shall be imposed by the Secretary unless
the person concerned,—

(i) is given a notice in writing informing him of the grounds on which the fine
is to be imposed; and

(i) is given an opportunity of being heard within such reasonable time as may
be specified in the notice.

(2) While fixing the fine under sub-section (1), the Secretary shall consider the size
or quantity of the waste involved, the category, size and location of the household, hotel,
industry or other establishment and any rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the
Government in this behalf.

(3) Any fine imposed under this chapter shall be recovered as arrears of public
revenue as specified in section 538 B.”.

21. Amendment of section 509 —1In section 509 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), before the figure “390”the figures, letter and symbols “326C,
327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted,

(ii) in sub-section (6), before the figure “390”the figures, letter and symbols“326C,
327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted,; :

(iii) in sub-section (7), before the figure “390” the figures, letter and symbols
“326C, 327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted.

22. Amendment of section 565.—In section 565 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2), after clause (u), the following clauses shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(v) matters relating to waste management as specified in chapter XVI A,

(w) matters relating to construction-demolition waste, e -waste, sanitary waste,
domestic hazardous waste, plastic waste and liquid waste subject to the Environment
(Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”,

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




30

23. Amendment of section 570.—In section 570 of the principal Act,—i) in clause (a),
for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” and for the words “fifty
rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall
be substituted.

24. Amendment of section 572.—In sub-section (1) of section 572 of the principal Act,
after the word “Government”, the words “or an officer authorised by the Government” shall
be inserted.

25. Amendment of Fourth Schedule —In the Fourth Schedule of the principal Act, under
the heading “Penalties” in column (1),—

(i) against section 253, in column (3), for the words “Failure to furnish list of
employees etc” the words and symbol“ Failure to furnish name of institutions etc.” shall be
substituted,;

(ii) against section 335,—

(a) in column (3), for the words “Improper disposal of carcasses rubbish and
filth” the words “Responsibility to keep the premises ef shops and commercial establishments
clean” shall be substituted;

(b) in column (4), for the words “Rupees five hundred” the words “Rupees ten
thousand” shall be substituted;

(iii) section 337 and the entries against it in columns (3) and (4) shall be omitted;

(iv) against section 339, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two hundred and
fifty” the words “Rupees five thousand” shall be substituted;

(v) against section 340, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two thousand”
the words “Rupees ten thousand” shall be substituted;

(vi) against section 492, in column (2), for the figure “2” the figure “12” shall
be substituted.

26. Repeal and saving—(l) The Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2023
(3 of 2023) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the
principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the principal Act as amended by this Act.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2024 pr=.

This is a digitally signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose kerala gov.in/

Digitally signed by Veeran T
Date2024.03.04 09:58:47 +05:30





